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NEW BALTIMORE 

— Rain and high winds 
blew through New Bal-
timore on the Fourth of 
July, downing trees and 
power lines.

Town and county 
workers spent much of the 
holiday evening clearing 
roads and debris from the 
storm.

New Baltimore High-
way Superintendent Alan 
VanWormer said the first 
call came in from Greene 
County 911 at around 9 
p.m. alerting the town to 
several trees that were 
blown down by high 
winds on Main Street, 
south of Church Street.

VanWormer said he 
notified the Greene Coun-
ty Highway Department 
as Main Street is a county 
road and falls under their 
jurisdiction.

Within moments, an-
other call came in regard-
ing more trees that were 
knocked down on Mill 
Street. 

“The town highway 
crew sprung into action, 
not only clearing our 
own roads, but assisting 
Greene County Highway 
in clearing theirs,” Van-
Wormer said. 

The fire department 
also assisted in clean-up 
efforts, he added.

“The Cornell Hook 
and Ladder Fire Compa-

ny also responded with 
manpower to assist in re-
moving debris from the 
roadway as it was cut by 
highway personnel,” Van-
Wormer said.

With the highway and 
fire departments collabo-
rating to clear the blocked 
streets, all roads were 
open and passable by 1 
a.m., with the exception 
of Mill Street, where a 
utility pole remained bro-
ken, with downed wires.

Town and county high-
way crews were back 
on the road Wednesday 
morning to begin clean-up 
efforts in the wake of the 
holiday storm.
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Courtesy of Pexels    
A proposed local law would prohibit the keeping of farm animals like goats, chickens, sheep, ponies and 
ducks, among others, in some zones in the town.

Contributed photo    
High winds knocked down trees and power lines in New Baltimore, leaving highway crews with a big clean-
up job for several days after.
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COEYMANS — The 

town is expected to revise 
a proposed law prohibit-
ing farm animals and fowl 
in some areas of the town.

Proposed Local Law 
No. 8 of 2023 would 
make it unlawful for farm 
animals or fowl to be kept 
within the commercial, 
business or industrial 
zones in the town. 

But pleas from sever-
al residents whose homes 
are in the industrial zone 
led town officials to re-
consider portions of the 
law. Those changes are 
expected to be made at the 
town board’s next meet-
ing July 13 and if enacted, 
would remove the town’s 
industrial zone from the 
prohibition.

The law would make it 
unlawful to keep animals 

including cows, cattle, 
horses, ponies, donkeys, 
mules, pigs, goats, sheep, 
chickens, roosters, ducks, 
geese and others.

Resident Emily Zink-
hen lives in Selkirk but 
the land surrounding her 
home is zoned industri-
al for the town of Coey-
mans, she told the board at 
a public hearing June 22.

“In the early spring 
of 2020, as COVID re-
strictions and lockdowns 
were being put in place, 
our family rescued a little 
black sheep from slaugh-
ter,” Zinkhen said. “We 
raised her as if she were 
a puppy, with love and re-
spect, and in turn she ate 
our weeds and fertilized 
our soil. That November, 
my family rescued a pig 
from a breeder in Tennes-
see. She became a mem-
ber of our family quickly 
and helps us refresh our 

garden and till our soil. 
The next spring brought 
us a baby goat and anoth-
er sheep, both of which 
were rescued from certain 
death at a meat market.”

The animals have be-
come members of the 
family, Zinkhen said.

“Our two sheep, goat 
and pig are beloved pets. 
They keep us sane during 
hard times and greatly im-
prove not only the qual-
ity of our lives, but the 
quality of our land,” she 
said. “We look forward to 
spending our time caring 
for them, especially when 
times get a little rougher. 
Fruit trees and gardens 
now grow where the soils 
were once dust, and our 
grass truly is greener with 
them here.”

The passage of Local 
Law No. 8 in its original 
form would negatively 
impact her family and 

home, which is otherwise 
“surrounded by industry 

and pollution,” Zinkhen 
said.

Zinkhen’s mother, 

Town mulling farm animal law

Fourth of July storm downs trees, damages power lines

Melanie Lekocevic/Capital Region Independent Media    
Norma June, honored with a bench dedicated in her name, greets 
family and friends at a celebration at Henry Hudson Park on Saturday.

Melanie Lekocevic/Capital Region Independent Media    
Norma June and her daughter, Phyllis Buckley, try out the new bench with a plaque honoring June’s work 
in the community over more than five decades.
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SELKIRK — Over 

more than 50 years of 
service, Norma June left 
an indelible mark on her 
community and on Sat-
urday, the community 
turned out to show how 
much they appreciate her 

contributions.
June, 94, now lives at a 

residential facility in Co-
lumbia County, but greet-
ed friends and family at 
a ceremony this weekend 
at Henry Hudson Park, 
where a bench dedicated 
in her honor was unveiled.

June, writing under the 

pen name “Murt Emmet,” 
wrote two columns for the 
Ravena News-Herald for 
more than half a century, 
often sitting by the side of 
the Hudson River to gain 
inspiration.

So, it seemed only fit-
ting that a bench in her 
honor sit beside the river 

where she wrote some of 
her best works.

June was a volunteer 
with the Selkirk Fire De-
partment and for Del-
mar-Bethlehem EMS for 
half a century, bringing 
her compassionate care to 
anyone who needed it.

“Today we are present-

ing Norma with a bench 
to remind the public of the 
years of service that she 
had put out for the public 
— over 50 years with the 
ambulance and with the 
Selkirk fire district,” said 
District Fire Chief Thom-
as Neri. “She was a center 
of the community — she 

knew everybody. If we 
went to an accident, she 
knew who the person was. 
If we went to a fire call, 
she knew who the person 
was. She was known by 
everybody in the town 
because she was always 
helping people.”

June was a volunteer 
with the Selkirk fire com-
pany’s fire police, doing 
stints as the department’s 
president and secretary.

She was also a found-
ing member of the Beth-
lehem Historical Associa-
tion and was a key figure 
in securing the former 
one-room schoolhouse on 
River Road in Selkirk as 
the museum’s permanent 
home.

“She was very active 
in the community,” Neri 
said.

June’s daughter, Phyl-
lis Buckley, said having 

Former columnist, volunteer Norma June: A life of service

See NORMA A2



Gina Al-Mahdi, broke 
into tears as she addressed 
the board at the public 
hearing.

“Not only did we save 
these animals, but these 
animals saved my chil-
dren and my family,” 
she said. “We need them. 
They aren’t nobody. They 
even have Instagram (ac-
counts), and people fol-
low them. They harm no-
body.”

Al-Mahdi said her 
children with special 
needs have greatly ben-
efited from having the 
animals around. The ani-
mals have helped alleviate 
symptoms of depression 
and helped the children 
develop life and social 
skills.

“I just wanted to point 
out that not only did we 

save them, but they saved 
us as well,” Al-Mahdi 
said.

Selkirk resident Janet 
Kessler spoke on behalf 
of the family and their an-
imals.

“These people have 
had these animals — they 
are considered pets,” Kes-
sler said.

No other community 
members spoke out on 
behalf of keeping farm 
animals on properties 
in either the business or 
commercial zones, and 
Town Supervisor George 
McHugh said the town 
council could revise the 
law to omit industrial 
zones.

“Frankly, the com-
plaints that we’re receiv-
ing are not from the indus-
trial zones, they are from 

the commercial and busi-
ness districts,” McHugh 
said.

Resident Barbara 
Tanner asked if the farm 
animals at the Zinkhen 
property would be grand-
fathered in in the event the 
law is passed in its origi-
nal form.

“They would not be,” 
McHugh responded. “But 
that doesn’t mean that 
we’re going to keep in-
dustrial in.”

McHugh said the town 
council would consult 
with the town attorney be-
fore adopting the law, and 
that a revised law may 
be presented at the next 
meeting of the town coun-
cil on July 13.
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ANIMAL from A1

Contributed photo    
Town and county workers cleaned up debris from a straight-line wind storm in the town of New Baltimore 
on the Fourth of July.

Contributed photo    
A damaged tree hangs perilously over the road in New Baltimore.

Ongoing clean-up con-
tinued for another week 
with storm debris littering 
several areas in the town  
including Cornell Park 

and Matthew Point.
The slow-moving In-

dependence Day storm 
brought high winds and 
heavy rainfall to the Cap-
ital Region, according to 
the National Weather Ser-

vice in Albany, affecting 
broad swaths of Greene, 
Albany, Columbia, Sche-
nectady and Montgomery 
counties, among other ar-
eas.

STORM from A1
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RAVENA — A car 

crash on Main Street this 
weekend knocked out 
power and severely dam-
aged utility poles, leading 
to a power outage in the 
village.

The accident occurred 
around 2 a.m. Saturday 
on Main Street when a 
red pickup truck struck a 
pair of utility poles near 
the corner of Route 9W, 
according to the Ravena 
Fire Department.

The poles were se-
verely damaged and pow-
er was knocked out for 
around two hours.

One patient was evalu-
ated for injuries by EMS 
but was not transported to 
the hospital, according to 
the fire department.

Main Street was tem-
porarily closed as crews 
worked to remove the ve-
hicle and clean up debris. 
Power was restored at 
around 4 a.m.

Central Hudson crews 
worked throughout the 
weekend to replace the 

broken utility poles.
In addition to the Rav-

ena Fire Department, first 
responders assisting on 
the scene included the 
Ravena Rescue Squad, 

Albany County Paramed-
ics, Albany County Sher-
iff’s Office, Coeymans 
Police Department, Rav-
ena Highway Department 
and Central Hudson.

Melanie Lekocevic/Capital Region Independent Media    
Central Hudson crews worked to restore power and repair broken utility poles after a car crash on Main 
Street this weekend.

Courtesy of Ravena Fire Department    
A motor vehicle accident on Main Street knocked out power and 
closed the road for a couple of hours early Saturday morning.

Crash closes Main Street, 
knocks out power

Melanie Lekocevic/Capital Region Independent Media     
District Fire Chief Thomas Neri of the Selkirk FIre Department greets June at a ceremony at Henry Hudson 
Park on Saturday.

Melanie Lekocevic/Capital Region Independent Media    
District Fire Chief Thomas Neri addresses the crowd that gathered at the park to honor June for her 
accomplishments over more than half a century.

Melanie Lekocevic/Capital Region Independent Media    
June with her daughter, Phyllis Buckley.

a bench dedicated in her 
honor was a fitting tribute.

“This is due — she 
served in so many ways,” 
Buckley said. “So many 
times I would walk into 
a store or restaurant and 
people would tell me all 
the things my mother did 
for them. She would doc-
tor them, comfort them, 
hold their hand, whatever 
they needed. Even at the 
nursing home, she is still 
helping people.”

June’s works at the 
Ravena News-Herald 
spanned over a half cen-
tury. Her News and Views 
column always featured a 
sketch of a lion and the ta-
gline “Keep your powder 
dry” at the end of the col-
umn. The tagline is also 
included on the plaque 
that adorns the park 
bench, recalling yet an-
other of her contributions 
to the community. 

She wrote weekly, for 
decades, about the go-
ings-on in the area, drop-

ping off her handwritten 
columns to the newspa-
per’s Ravena office with-
out fail. See samples of 
her writing on page A8.

Ever a Renaissance 
woman, June also wrote 
poetry, and a volume of 
her works was published 
by Bleezarde Publishing, 
the former owner of the 
Ravena News-Herald.

Neri said researching 
June’s many contributions 
to the community and her 
more than 50 years of ser-
vice was challenging be-
cause much of her work 
pre-dates computers.

“I got to the number 50 
and just said, let’s put 50-
plus, because I can’t even 
research that far back,” 
Neri told the crowd with 
a laugh.

“You don’t know how 
much you have affect-
ed this community and 
helped people,” he told 
her.

Nancy Newkirk from 
the Bethlehem Historical 
Association read one of 

June’s poems, “River of 
Legend and Lore,” at the 
dedication ceremony.

“Norma is one of the 
founding members of the 
historical association, so 
we are pleased to be here 
today to recognize this 
great honor,” Newkirk 
told June. “It’s been more 
than 50 years with Beth-
lehem Historic. We thank 
you for everything that 
you’ve done.”

June and her son, Herb 
June, were instrumen-
tal in getting the former 
one-room schoolhouse to 
serve as a permanent his-
torical museum, Newkirk 
said.

Norma June has six 
children, 21 grandchil-
dren and around a dozen 
great-grandchildren. 

She said she will never 
forget Saturday’s ceremo-
ny.

“This was unbeliev-
able,” June said. “It’s one 
of the moments of history 
that I will hang onto for-
ever and ever.”

NORMA from A1



Local and County

News Herald – July 
6, 1923 - F.E. Bleezarde, 
Publisher

Coeymans:
• The threatening 

weather conditions on 
the Fourth of July spoiled 

the outings that many had 
planned and the showers 
in the afternoon drove 
many home that were out 
for the day.

• The sacrament of the 
Lord’s supper was ob-
served in the M.E. church 
last Sunday morning. Two 
were received into full 
membership in the church.

• Edward K. Uthe 
was driving a team down 
Westerlo Street Tuesday 
morning when a portion of 
the harness broke, which 
allowed the wagon tongue 
to fail. The team became 
frightened and ran down 
the street. When near 
Carhart gent’s furnishing 
store, the wagon collided 

with a tree and was over-
turned, pinning Mr. Uthe 
under the wagon. He was 
extricated. It was found 
that no bones were bro-
ken, but he suffered con-
siderable from the shak-
ing up he received.

• Mrs. Orra Hawn and 
daughter of Albany are 
visiting her father, Dr. 
A.T. Powell.

• Mr. and Mrs. Clare 
Robbins of this place 
and Mr. and Mrs. Lauren 
Robbins of Schenectady 
are enjoying camp life at 
Schroon Lake.

Ravena:
• The Fourth of July 

passed away in this village 
in a blaze of glory and lots 

of music in the air. The 
band concert and display 
of fireworks planned by 
the Ravena Hose Co., and 
the Ravena Band proved a 
big attraction to a couple 
of thousand out of town 
folks, who came in hun-
dreds of cars and filled 
lower Main Street and 
West Shore Street.

• Community Chautau-
qua will be here again for 
its five days of pleasure 
and education beginning 
the program on Tuesday 
evening, July 10, with a 
concert and entertainment 
by the John Ross Reed 
Company. Tickets are for 
sale by the members of the 
association from whom 

they can be purchased at 
the regular price of $2.50.

• Born to Mr. and Mrs. 
Daniel Makely, a daugh-
ter, on Wednesday last.

• William V. Roberts 
played in the Shriners 
Band, whose concert was 
broadcasted from WGY 
last Thursday night.

• The installation of of-
ficers of LeRoy M. Whip-
ple Council, No. 96 will 
be held on Friday night, 
July 27, instead of July 
13. The change in date has 
been made on account of 
Chautauqua. The regular 
business meeting will be 
held on Friday evening 
July 13, and every mem-
ber is urged to attend.

Coeymans Herald – 
July 4, 1888 - S.H. & E.J. 
Sherman, Proprietors

• H. Slingerland has 
had his dock front rebuilt.

• A cargo of coal was 
discharged Saturday for 
the Lotta.

• Baeren Island is en-
gaged for 27 excursions 
during the month of July.

• The employees of 
S.L. Munson’s big collar 
establishment in Albany 
had a complimentary ex-
cursion on Baeren Island 
Saturday.

• “Jeffersonian sim-
plicity” in summer means 
short sleeves and trousers 
but no collar.

IN MEMORY OF
Harry A. Sturges

News from the Past in Memory of Harry A. Sturges
Thursday, July 13, 2023  A3Ravena News-Herald | Capital Region Independent Media

VETERAN OWNED 
NANO FARM BREWERY

Trackside Pizza is right behind 
our Brewery offering Pizza, 

Wings Sandwiches and Burgers. 
You’re welcome to bring 

in your own food too. 

Also Available: 
32oz Crowlers & 

16oz 4-Pack Cans To Go.

109 MAIN STREET, RAVENA, NY • 518.756.2320

Offering a Variety of On-Site 
Craft Beers along with NY made 

Hard Cider & Sangria.

July 18-23, 2023July 18-23, 2023

Saratoga County Fair Saratoga County Fair 
a summer tradition since 1841a summer tradition since 1841

Schedule Of Events!

SaratogaCountyFair.orgSaratogaCountyFair.org
BuyBuy TICKETS ONLINETICKETS ONLINEDON’T WAIT IN LINEDON’T WAIT IN LINE

SEE THE FULL CALENDAR OF EVENTS:SEE THE FULL CALENDAR OF EVENTS:
HTTPS://SARATOGACOUNTYFAIR.ORG/EVENTS/HTTPS://SARATOGACOUNTYFAIR.ORG/EVENTS/

TUE. JULY 18
• NS DAKOTAS: 7-10PM
• FIGURE 8 RACE: 7:30PM

WED. JULY 19
• DOUG VILLANO BAND: 
7-10PM
• DEMO DERBY: 7:30PM

THU. JULY 20
• HOT FARM OUT 
 OF THE FIELD TRACTOR  
 PULLS: 6PM
• GRIT-N-WHISKEY: 7-10PM

FRI. JULY 21
• SKEETER CREEK: 7-11PM
• NYTPA TRACTOR 
 PULLS: 7PM

SAT. JULY 22
• JUKEBOX 
 REBELLION: 7-11PM
• TRUCK PULLS: 7PM

SUN. JULY 23
• ROXY AND 
 THE ROLLERS: 4-8PM
• DEMO DERBY: 6:30PM

EVERYDAY
• LANCE GIFFORD MAGIC & HYPNOSIS SHOWS

EXTREME RAPTORS
HOT DOG RING RACING PIGS

Offer expires 11/13/23. Restrictions apply. Call for details.

3 Year TV
Price

Guarantee

Smart HD DVR included.

AMERICA’S TOP 120

190 $7999/mo.
Channels

Great entertainment  
with a local touch.

HI-TECH ADVISERS
(888) 633-6082

1H_2023_GM_Mini_Ad_3.22x5_SL2.indd   11H_2023_GM_Mini_Ad_3.22x5_SL2.indd   1 6/23/2023   3:44:20 PM6/23/2023   3:44:20 PM

HUDSON — The Co-
lumbia-Greene Humane 
Society/SPCA (CGHS/
SPCA) is asking for the 
public’s help in identify-
ing two dogs that were 
victims of animal cruelty.

CGHS/SPCA are look-
ing for the owners of two 
dogs that were found on 
Schoolhouse Road in 
Claverack. 

One dog was found 
incapacitated and died 
on his way to emergency 
care. After a full exam-

ination by CGHS/SPCA 
technicians, the dog 
was found to be emaci-
ated with open wounds 
that were untreated. The 
wounds were filled with 
maggots.  

The second dog, now 
named Juliet, was brought 
to CGHS/SPCA where 
she’s receiving medical 
attention and being treat-
ed for starvation and de-
hydration.  

Both dogs were scored 
as a 1 on a scale of 1 to 

9 using the Nestle/Purina 
Body Condition System. 
With this system, 1 is very 
thin/emaciated and 9 is 
obese.

CGHS/SPCA is offer-
ing a $1,000 reward for 
information leading to the 
arrest and conviction of 
the person(s) responsible 
for these acts of cruelty. 

“We’re asking the pub-
lic’s help with these hei-
nous acts of animal cru-
elty. As a society, we are 
obligated to bring those 

responsible to justice,” 
said CGHS/PSCA Presi-
dent and Cruelty Investi-
gator Ron Perez. “These 
two poor creatures were 
subjected to horrible ne-
glect, starvation, and de-
nial of medical attention. 
If anyone has any infor-
mation on these two dogs, 
please don’t hesitate to 
call us at 518-828-6044 
ext. 108.”

All information will be 
kept confidential.

Humane Society seeks help in animal cruelty case

Contributed photo    
Juliet, one of the dogs found in Columbia County, was determined to 
be emaciated.

Contributed photo   
Juliet is recovering at the Columbia-Greene Humane Society.

Contributed photo    
One of the dogs died on the way to medical care after he was found.

Contributed photo    
The winners of the 44th annual youth fishing derby pose with their trophies. Pictured, with members of 
the R.C. Sportsmen’s Association, are prize winners Samantha White, Isabella Ciccarelli, Anthony Camarda, 
Kyley Goewey, Jacob Shear, Cassidy Shutter, Emma Done, Owen Barger, Theo Malloy and Maddox Frankovic.

By Melanie Lekocevic
Capital Region 

Independent Media
COEYMANS — Fam-

ilies turned out for the an-
nual fishing derby hosted 
by the R.C. Sportsmen’s 
Club.

The fishing derby, held 
every June, is now in its 
44th year.

Held at the Coeymans 
Filtration Plant on Route 
144, the fishing der-
by invites children ages 
1-16 in the Ravena-Co-
eymans-Selkirk Central 
School District to try their 
hand at fishing.

Trophies are awarded 
annually in a number of 
categories and everyone 

gets a prize, hot dogs and 
refreshments after the 
fishing is over. 

This year’s winners 
were Samantha White, 
Isabella Ciccarelli, An-
thony Camarda, Kyley 
Goewey, Jacob Shear, 
Cassidy Shutter, Emma 
Done, Owen Barger, Theo 
Malloy and Maddox Fran-
kovic.

Each of the winners 
was awarded a trophy.

Sponsors of the annu-
al fishing derby included: 
Access Safety Products, 
Biscone Law Firm, Burns 
and Son, C.A. Albright 
and Sons, Carver Com-
panies, Crossroads Ford, 

Francisco Equipment, 
Bank of Greene County, 
Greene County Federa-
tion of Sportsmen, Greene 
County Legislature, Rav-
ena Shop ‘N’ Save, in 
memory of J.R. Schro-
eder, John T. Biscone, 
Esq., K&D Auto Repair, 
Mueller’s Automotive, 
NAPA (Ravena), Nation-
al Bank of Coxsackie, 
National Stone Supplies, 
Persico Hardware, Rav-
ena News-Herald, SAB-
IC, Selkirk Transmission, 
Stewart’s Shops (Ravena), 
Stolz Insurance Agency, 
Town of Coeymans, Trin-
ity Construction and Big 
Top Portables.

Kids turn out for annual fishing derby



COXSACKIE — On 
Tuesday, July 18, the 
Greene County Historical 
Society is pleased to wel-
come local researcher Eva 
Behr, who will present a 
program on the history of 
the Palenville Cemetery 

and the stories of the peo-
ple buried there.

Amidst the clamor of 
the important tanners and 
boarding house keepers of 
Palenville, there are qui-
eter stories, told by those 
interred in the cemetery. 

Meet Hannah Van De 
Bogart Palen, mother of 
seven children, widowed 
in 1822 at 35 years of age, 
who opts not to marry 
again, raising her children 
and two sets of grandchil-
dren, her story is told in 
the family bible and store 
ledgers. 

Hear the story of Ed-
ward Londo, basketmak-
er and the “last” of the 
Mohawks, immigrating 
to Palenville from Sara-
toga Springs and dying in 
1938. 

And, Mary Whitney 
Mower, born in 1903, re-
homed at two, married at 
16, washing the boarding 
house laundry, running a 
small store, and remem-
bered as a warm and lov-
ing woman by her sum-
mer neighbors.

Come hear the stories 
whispered in the Palen-
ville Cemetery on Tues-
day, July 18, at 7 p.m. in 
the Reading Room of the 
Vedder Research Library 
on the grounds of the 
Bronck Museum located 
at 90 County Route 42, 
Coxsackie, N.Y. 

Suggested donation 
for this lecture is $10. 
For more information 
call 518-731-6490 or visit 
www.gchistory.org.

Neighbors

Senior Projects
RAVENA — Senior 

Projects of Ravena of-
fers dinner every Monday 
and Thursday at 5 p.m., 
and lunch on Tuesdays, 
Wednesdays and Fridays. 
at noon. Senior Projects 
of Ravena is located at 9 
Bruno Boulevard, Rav-
ena.

If there is a senior who 
needs assistance or you 
are concerned about a se-
nior, please call Senior 
Projects at 518-756-8593.

Below is the menu for 
the week of July 17 to July 
21.

MONDAY:
Baked chicken, baked 

sweet potato, corn, bread, 
milk and coffee.

TUESDAY: 
Herb-crusted fish, sea-

soned oven roasted po-
tatoes, Brussels sprouts, 
bread, milk and coffee.

WEDNESDAY:
Chicken tacos with 

cheese, salsa, sour cream, 

shredded lettuce and to-
matoes, sauteed zucchi-
ni and summer squash, 
bread, milk and coffee.

THURSDAY: 
Baked ham, pineapple 

sauce, scalloped potatoes, 
peas and carrots, tropical 
fruit, bread, milk and cof-
fee.

FRIDAY: 
Chili con carne, Brus-

sels sprouts, corn bread, 
bread, milk and coffee.

RCS COMMUNITY 
LIBRARY

• Lego Challenge
Thursday, July 13, 

from 2-3 p.m.
Calling all school-aged 

Lego fans, come to the li-
brary to build a Lego mas-
terpiece from the library’s 
collection of Legos. 
Build according to the 
Lego Challenge prompt 
or make an inspired cre-
ation directly from your 
imagination. Registration 
is required at rcscommu-
nitylibrary.org as space is 
limited.

• Romp and Read
Friday, July 14, 
from 10-11 a.m.

Romp and Read will 
help get the wiggles out 
on Tuesdays and Fridays 
at 10 a.m. with interactive 
themes, stories and action 
songs with props. No need 
to register.
• Traveling Farm from 

Winterberry Homestead
Monday, July 17, 

from 6-7 p.m.
Meet the animals of 

Winterberry Homestead 
Farm at the library! Learn 
about how these animals 
contribute to sustainable 
agriculture and have the 
opportunity to pet each 
animal. This event will be 
held at the Mosher Park 
Pavilion. Bring a blanket 
or lawn chair. Please reg-
ister at rcscommunityli-

brary.org so the library 
can notify you in the event 
of a location change due 
to inclement weather. For 
ages 3 and up.

• Romp and Read
Tuesday, July 18, 
from 10-11 a.m.

Romp and Read will 
help get the wiggles out 
on Tuesdays and Fridays 
at 10 a.m. with interactive 
themes, stories and action 
songs with props. No need 
to register.

• Family Storytime
Wednesday, July 19, 

from 10-11 a.m.
Family Storytime 

meets on Wednesdays 
at 10 a.m. and combines 
music, movement, stories 
and play to encourage ear-
ly literacy. For kids of all 
ages (and their grown-ups, 
too!). No need to register.

• Wednesday Movie – 
“Champions”

Wednesday, July 19, 
from 2-4:30 p.m.

The library will show 
the film “Champions,” 
starring Woody Harrleson. 
“The hilarious and heart-
warming story of a former 
minor-league basketball 
coach who, after a series 
of missteps, is ordered 
by the court to manage a 
team of players with in-
tellectual disabilities. He 
soon realizes that despite 

his doubts, together, this 
team can go further than 
they ever imagined.” Rat-
ed PG-13. Registration at 
rcscommunitylibrary.org 
is appreciated but not re-
quired. For adults.

• Stories and Fun 
in the Park

Wednesday, July 19, 
from 6:30-7:30 p.m.
Join in at the Mosher 

Park Pavilion for a mix 
of stories and play with 
activities, crafts or exper-
iments to try. Please reg-
ister at rcscommunityli-
brary.org so you can be 
contacted in the event that 
inclement weather results 
in a change of location.

• Lunchtime Books 
on hiatus 

The Lunchtime Book 
Club is taking a break for 
summer vacation. Join in 
when the club starts up 
again in September.

NEW FICTION
“The Door-to-Door 

Bookstore” by Carsten 
Henn

“The Collector” by 
Daniel Silva

“The Beach at Sum-
merly” by Beatriz Wil-
liams

“Flags on the Bayou” 
by James Lee Burke

“The Air Raid Club” 
by Annie Lyons

Ravenanewsroom@gmail.comRavenanewsroom@gmail.comRavenanewsroom@gmail.com
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On Tuesday, July 18, local researcher Eva Behr will present a program 
at the Bronck Museum on the history of the Palenville Cemetery and 
the stories of the people buried there.

Cemetery history 
presentation at 
Bronck Museum

By Dane Weintraub
For Capital Region

 Independent Media
When I first heard of 

the ruling from the Su-
preme Court allowing cer-
tain businesses to be able 
to discriminate against 
LGBT, I was first shocked 
then disappointed, sad and 
now frustrated and scared. 

I was in the closet for 
most of my life and saw 
how gay people were 
treated firsthand. I’m in 
my 60s now. I’ve been 
with my husband for 26 
years. It wasn’t until my 
late 30s, when I started 
to see myself being rep-
resented in TV shows 
and movies, that I felt 
less afraid. This eventu-
ally gave me courage to 
come out and eventually 
get married. Now, seeing 
all this hatred, it is scary 

times again. 
I wouldn’t want to 

walk into a business to 
ask to have a service per-
formed and then be made 
to feel less than they are. 
I would need to know up-
front from the business so 
I wouldn’t subject myself 
to that trauma again. 

I think they need to 
add some conditions to 
that law. I want the busi-
ness to publicly disclose 
what groups they discrim-
inate against. I want pub-
lic disclosure on all their 
promotional materials and 
business cards, posted 
at their entrances next to 
their hours, on their menu 
boards at their drive-ups, 
on the home page of their 
website and all their social 
media accounts, and if 
they sell products on hubs 
like Amazon, it should be 

included in their vendor 
profiles. 

Let the customers 
know you’re a bigot, ho-
mophobe, Islamophobia, 
antisemitic or transphobe. 
Have courage of your 
convictions and let cus-
tomers decide if they want 
to financially support your 
convictions. 

If a more welcoming 
competitor opens across 
the street and you go out 
of business, at least you 
know your right to not like 
certain groups was not vi-
olated. However, if some-
one discriminates against 
someone or a group and 
they didn’t publicly dis-
close it, they should be 
sued and face fines.

Dane Weintraub is a 
subscriber to the Ravena 
News-Herald.

The fight against 
LGBTQ+ rights

Crossroads Ford
We are locally-owned & operated & our staff is customer-friendly with no 

pressure, so you can make the best decision for your next vehicle purchase.

518-756-4000 • 2351 Rt. 9W Ravena, NY • (Just 10 miles South of Albany)

2022 FORD  
ESCAPE SEL

MSRP: $37,625  
CROSSROADS PRICE:

$35,190

2022 FORD  
F-150 XL

MSRP: $55,615  
CROSSROADS PRICE:

$48,897

DON’T MISS OUT  
on the Last of 2022 Vehicles!

They are going with HUGE SAVINGS!

www.crossroadsny.com

8 passenger, 3.5L  
EcoBoost, Black  
Leather Interior, Pano 
Moonroof, Ford Co  
Pilot 360, 54,073 Miles.
$51,987

2021 FORD EXPEDITION MAX XLT

STK#  U11709T

V6, 6 Speed Automatic, 
Heated REAR Seats, 
Panoramic Moonroof, 
Driver Sport Package, 
44,807 Miles.
$25,995

2017 LINCOLN MKZ RESERVE

STK#  U11642C

PRE-OWNED SPECIALS 
2019 LINCOLN NAUTILUS

Black Label, AWD,  
4dr SUV, Pano Moonroof, 

V6 Turbo, SATT Radio,  
Navigation, Back Up 

Camera, 42,009 Miles.
$42,995 STK#  U11697PT

2017 FORD F250 XLT 4X4
SUPERCAB, FX4, OFF 

ROAD, LONG BED, 6.2L 
V8, Spray In Bed Liner, 

Running Boards, Fog 
Lamps, 75,435 Miles.
$39,995 STK#  U11724T
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WESTERLO — The 
Hannacroix Rural Ceme-
tery, which is located on 
Route 411 in Dormans-
ville/Westerlo, is seeking 
donations for the 2023 
mowing expenses for the 
cemetery.  

Whether you have a 
loved one buried there 
or would just like to give 
a donation, it would be 
greatly appreciated. 

Many thanks to all 
who have helped in the 
past. 

Your help is needed to 
keep the cemetery main-
tained. Contributions can 
be sent to: Hannacroix 
Rural Cemetery, c/o Lin-
da Smith, Treasurer, 115 
State Route 143, Wester-
lo, New York 12193.

Hannacroix Rural Cemetery 
seeks 2023 mowing donations

My View



The River Barrow, 
the second longest river 
in Ireland, is an enchant-
ing lifeline that courses 
through the country’s 
southeastern landscapes. 
Beginning its journey in 
the Slieve Bloom Moun-
tains, it weaves its way 
through verdant valleys 
and ancient towns, finally 
merging with its sister riv-
ers, the Nore and the Suir, 
before surrendering itself 
to the Celtic Sea.

The Barrow’s lyrical 
beauty is inescapable as 
it winds through Ireland’s 
heartlands. Shifting with 
the seasons, it presents a 
living tapestry — emerald 
green in spring, dappled 
gold in autumn, starkly 
beautiful in winter’s grip 
and riotously colorful in 
the peak of summer. The 
river’s surface mirrors 
the cerulean Irish sky on 
a sunny day, appearing as 
a sheet of molten silver, 
while on cloudy days, it 
borrows the gray from 
overcast heavens, craft-
ing a spectacle that is both 
dramatic and melancholic.

The River Barrow is 
more than just a waterway, 
it’s a lifeline and a provid-
er. Home to diverse flora 
and fauna, it is a haven for 
naturalists. Kingfishers 
dart across the water, ot-
ters frolic along the banks, 
and salmon and trout leap 
in its currents. The river 
teems with life, standing 
as a testament to nature’s 
resilience and abundance.

The allure of the River 
Barrow lies in the serene 
tranquility it offers amidst 
the relentless pace of 
the modern world. It is a 
place where time appears 
to slow, where the soul 
finds solace in the rhythm 
of flowing water and the 
rustling leaves. It is a liv-
ing painting, a poem and a 
song, all at once.

By naming a Thor-
oughbred horse “River 
Barrow,” one captures 
the river’s strength, beau-
ty, resilience and time-
less grace. Like the river 
that brims with life and 
tells stories of resilience 
and constancy, the horse, 

too, embodies innate 
strength and majesty. 
This name signifies not 
only the horse’s connec-
tion to nature, but also to 
the heritage and culture 
represented by the river. 
Hence, “River Barrow” 
is a compelling choice for 
a Thoroughbred destined 
for greatness.

On April 29, 2004, in 
Ontario, Canada, when 
the mare Valid Secret gave 
birth to a long-legged dark 
gray filly sired by Cat’s At 
Home, her breeder, Or-
monde Farm, christened 
her “River Barrow.” The 
Canadian breeder had 
purchased Valid Secret at 
Keeneland in Kentucky 
back in November 2000.

Ormonde Farm, based 
in Ontario, derives its 
name from the horse Or-
monde (1883–1904), an 
undefeated English Thor-
oughbred racehorse who 
clinched the 1886 English 
Triple Crown and was 
hailed as the “horse of the 
century.”

During the five years 
that Ormonde owned 
Valid Secret, River Bar-
row was the only foal to 
survive her youth. She 
was born not just into 
any lineage but into one 
of royalty, being a mater-
nal great-granddaughter 
of the celebrated Triple 
Crown winner, Secretar-
iat. Her lineage, akin to 
a noble human bloodline 
in horse-racing terms, 
led to her life being un-
der intense scrutiny and 
grand expectations. Rac-
ing under the banner of 
Canada’s Ormonde Farm, 
her career spanned the 
U.S. and Canada, earning 
black type at the tender 
age of two and amassing 
$114,825 in prize money 
over 35 races at seven dif-
ferent racetracks.

When River Barrow 
could no longer race, she 
was relocated to a breed-
ing farm. While pregnant 
with her fifth foal, River 
Barrow, like her moth-

er and her own offspring 
before, was sold through 
the Keeneland Auction in 
Kentucky. She was pur-
chased by Royal Kraft Sr., 
a stalwart of the Louisiana 
Thoroughbred Breeders 
Association, and she and 
the unborn foal within 
her were transported to 
Kraft’s quaint farm in 
Louisiana.

Of River Barrow’s six 
foals, four made it to the 
races, collectively earn-
ing over $140,000 on the 
racetrack. In 2020, at the 
age of 86, Kraft bred her 
back to Apriority. That 
fall, she was listed on his 
farm’s Facebook page, 
along with several other 
mares, for private sale.

With Kraft’s passing 
in late December 2020, 
River Barrow lost her pro-
tector. In a world where 
her prowess on the race-
track should have granted 
her value, she was quick-
ly dismissed. Louisiana 
horse traders, indifferent 
to her fate, ruthlessly dis-
carded River Barrow and 
her pasture mates, con-
signing them to Domi-
nique’s Livestock Market 

in Opelousas, Louisiana, 
a market infamous for its 
cruelty and harsh deal-
ings.

Sold for slaughter at 
Dominique’s, her world 
rapidly diminished to the 
grim confines of Jacob 
Thompson’s notorious 
feedlot in Louisiana. Amid 
the stress of the slaughter 
pipeline, the foal she car-
ried was lost. Surrounded 
by the echoes of hopeless 
whinnies, the stench of 
fear, and a palpable sense 
of despair, River Barrow 
experienced the worst of 
humanity. Filthy, with her 
tail cut off, alone, terrified, 
and alarmingly malnour-
ished, she was pleading 
for a lifeline to escape this 
living nightmare less than 
a month after the passing 
of her owner, Royal Kraft, 
Sr.

On the brink of obliv-
ion, Unbridled Sanctuary 
opened its doors to River 
Barrow. In January 2021, 
her troubles ended, and 
she, along with Beauty, 
Censored and Joy, all vic-
tims of the same dreadful 
pipeline, entered the life-
long care and protection 

of the Unbridled Thor-
oughbred Foundation.

At the Sanctuary, Riv-
er Barrow began her heal-
ing journey. No longer a 
commodity or a tool for 
production, she was now 
viewed as a sentient being 
deserving of care, dignity 
and respect. Little by lit-
tle, with countless hours 
of attention, gentle care 
and doses of Adequan to 
alleviate her lameness, 
she regained her strength 
and spirit.

Today, River Barrow 
stands as a beacon of 
hope, a survivor rising 
from the depths of despair. 
As a cherished equine 
family member at Unbri-
dled, she receives royal 
care and provisions to ac-
commodate her comfort 
every day. With nutrition, 
her tail has grown out so 
luxuriously that it touches 
the ground. She shares a 
profound bond with Joy 
and Beauty, and together, 
they form an inseparable 
trio, each a testament to 
resilience and the healing 
power of love.

Just like the river she is 
named for, River Barrow 

is a living embodiment of 
the true beauty that lies 
within every horse. She 
is a caring companion, an 
emotionally supportive 
friend, and a thoughtful 
equine teacher in all of 
the programs at Unbri-
dled. Her warm, dappled 
silvery coat and kindly 
eyes invite you to just be 
with her and reflect on the 
majesty of her being, and 
question how she could be 
treated with such indiffer-
ence. 

Unbridled aims to shat-
ter the existing paradigm 
of horse racing and breed-
ing, which often leaves 
these majestic animals to 
a grim fate. By illuminat-
ing the realities faced by 
Thoroughbreds, Unbri-
dled is sowing the seeds 
of change through advo-
cacy, education, hands-on 
engagement, and sharing 
the real, often overlooked 
stories of horses like Riv-
er Barrow.

Susan Kayne operates 
the horse rescue organiza-
tion Unbridled Thorough-
bred Foundation, on the 
border of Albany County 
and Greenville.

Back to Nature

Puttering around is 
an art form that as a fair-
ly new senior citizen I’m 
trying to fully understand 
and participate in. It is 
something that goes with 
the other responsibilities 
that fall upon a senior’s 
shoulders.  

Older folks are sup-
posed to putter around 
so I devote some time to 
it daily. Today I was put-
tering in the dining room, 
straightening up stuff and 
moving it from one spot 
to another, when in the 

corner cupboard I came 
across the basket of this 
year’s Christmas cards. I 
thumbed through them.  

They should have 
been discarded due to 
The Queen’s Anti-Clutter 
Campaign rules.  Some 
were beautiful scenes, 
there were picture cards 
of various family mem-
bers and their clans. There 
were picture cards of folks 
I didn’t recognize. 

There were a bunch 
of those newsy yearly 
reports on various fami-
ly groups and what their 
year had been like. They 
don’t interest me much. 
They are never really 
filled with stuff I need 
to know or even want to 
know, and frankly I don’t 
know how reliable they 
are. Things like: Bob was 
promoted and is now the 
CEO of such and such a 
company.  Sally married 
a Harvard Law graduate 

and is now living in the 
south of France where she 
is heading up a “Save the 
Whales” group. Our dog 
won “Best in Show” at 
Westminster this year — 
and so on. 

I suspect the truth 
might be more like: Bob 
lost his job and is drinking 
too much, we’ve moved 
into a trailer in our in-
laws’ back yard. Sally 
is dating a high school 
dropout with Harley tat-
toos and the dog bit the 
mailman again. That kind 
of news would be more 
interesting. 

Not knowing what 
might be a future family 
treasure, I put the basket 
back where I found it.

It did get me thinking 
about what constitutes a 
family treasure. All se-
niors reach a point at 
which the urge to “down-
size” kicks in. What are 
the things that I’ve got 

squirreled away that I 
would keep in my forever 
pile? 

Surprisingly, I realized 
that my pile wouldn’t have 
anything of monetary val-
ue in it.  Most of it would 
be considered junk by a 
stranger going through 
my stuff. My pile would 
have the angel tree topper 
that my dad bought for 
my first Christmas that’s 
been on the top of every 
Christmas tree I’ve ever 
had. There’s the folder of 
various little notes that 
I got from students over 
the years that I taught. 
I’d include the album of 
pictures of my kids at all 
stages of their lives, pic-
tures of my parents and 
siblings, pictures of my 
Queen and I in younger 
years. The pictures them-
selves aren’t that import-
ant but the memories they 
conjure up sure are.  

There’s a box of 

awards I’ve won that I 
like to thumb through 
once in a while. My desk 
has a small clipping from 
a newspaper showing a lit-
tle girl giving me a bunch 
of flowers and thanking 
me for saving her life; she 
died five years later. I’d 
keep that. I have a small 
bunch of various cards 
with a rubber band around 
them in my sock drawer. 
Father’s Day cards, Val-
entine’s, handmade cards 
with crayon drawings on 
them, ones with sweet 
notes on them, all keepers.  

I don’t think I’d like to 
lose the three big binders 
with more than a thou-
sand pages of newspaper 
columns that I’ve written 
because they document 
the later stages of my life 
and could show my grand-
daughter and grandkids 
yet to come what I was 
like.  

Funny that all the years 

I worked towards having a 
nice house, shiny cars and 
a bank account that was 
in black ink, those things 
didn’t make it into my 
mental pile of treasures.  
The other thing that kind 
of surprises me was how 
small that pile would be 
and how very precious it is 
to me.  I love these things 
but I could survive with-
out them because they are 
all tucked away safely in 
my heart’s memory banks.

Puttering sure is nice. 
I’m going to have to try to 
find time to do more of it.

Thought for the week 
— “The power of accurate 
observation is commonly 
called cynicism by those 
who have not got it.” ~ 
George Bernard Shaw

Until next week, may 
you and yours be happy 
and well.

Reach columnist Dick 
Brooks at Whittle12124@
yahoo.com.

DICK BROOKS

WHITTLING 
AWAY

Puttering
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Horses of 
Unbridled

SUSAN KAYNE

Echoing the River: 
The Story of ‘River Barrow’

Contributed photo    
River Barrow enjoys outdoor time in the winter.

Contributed photo    
River Barrow, right, with one of her friends.

Contributed photo   
River Barrow with one of the volunteers at Unbridled.

Contributed photo    
River Barrow receiving some TLC at Unbridled.
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Have you ever read this 
old yet poignant poem by 
Jessie B. Rittenhouse?

“I bargained with life 
for a penny,

And life would pay no 
more,

However, I begged at 
the evening

When I counted my 
scanty store.

For life is a just em-
ployer,

It gives you what you 
ask,

But once you have set 
the wages,

Why, you must bear the 
task.

I worked for a menial’s 
hire,

Only to learn, dis-
mayed,

That any wage I had 
asked of life,

Life would have will-
ingly paid.”

The poem underscores 
that life is prepared to offer 
us whatever we ask of it. 
But is that true? 

You might wonder, 
“I’ve dreamed of a better 
life, yet it hasn’t material-
ized. I’ve often asked, Why 
can’t I be a movie star? A 
pro athlete? Or even rich?’”

Are you asking, or are 
you complaining? 

Grumbling about the 
life you desire yet don’t 
have or envying what oth-
ers possess points to a big-
ger issue – a heart steeped 
in bitterness.

This self-victimization 
and surrender to circum-
stances turns into a life of 
negativity.

Ancient scriptures tell 
us that when we genuinely 

ask, we receive. But they 
also warn that grumbling 
lips can lead to ruin.

The poem hints at a nu-
anced interpretation of the 
word “ask.”

In this context, “ask” 
could be synonymous with 
“expect.” So, when you ask 
life for your desires, do you 
anticipate them materializ-
ing?

What have you sincere-
ly requested and expected 
from life?

I’ve heard it said that 
when you ask for some-
thing and actively move 
toward it, unseen forces 
come to your aid. 

Numerous individuals 
who have achieved remark-
able feats have personally 
witnessed this phenome-
non. I’ve seen it in my life.

Things align, the right 
people appear as if by mag-
ic, opportunities and situa-
tions fall into place, and the 
door to possibility swings 
wide open.

When you transition 
from a state of complaint 
and bitterness to asking 

with expectation, you 
evolve into a dreamer, an 
adventurer. You develop 
the faith that what you’ve 
asked for has already been 
granted; you need only 
continue working with a 
cheerful heart, secure in 
your impending triumph.

Think about this: How 
would you chase your 
dreams if you knew you 
couldn’t fail? 

Would you gripe about 
your dreams not material-
izing quickly enough? Or 
would you work tireless-
ly, filled with gratitude, to 
seize what life has offered 
you?

Author and motivation-
al speaker Tony Robbins 
shares a story of encoun-
tering a drunken man in 
a town square who asked 
him for a quarter.

Robbins pondered if he 
should reward this type of 
behavior. He has a giving 
heart, so he chose to give, 
attempting to impart a les-
son simultaneously.

He asked the man, “All 
you want is a quarter?” as 

he leafed through a stack 
of hundred-dollar bills, 
searching for some change.

The man’s eyes bulged 
at the sight of the mon-
ey, and he said something 
like, “Yes sir, a quarter 
would change my life,” as 
he anticipated receiving 
hundred-dollar bills, even 
though he’d only requested 
a quarter.

Robbins handed him 
a quarter, leaving the man 
to label him “weird” as he 
staggered into the night.

Life can sometimes be 
a harsh teacher. What are 
you asking of it? Are you 
pleading for just enough to 
get by, or are you seeking 
your dreams?

I’ve encountered folks 
who argue that it’s wrong 
to aspire to great things 
when so many have so lit-
tle.

I believe the universe 
has unlimited blessings to 
offer to those who ask and 
move toward their goals 
with the expectation of 
success. 

Am I suggesting that 

those who have noth-
ing have done something 
wrong?

Not at all. We all face 
unique advantages and dis-
advantages; some are born 
into hopeless situations 
with no apparent escape, 
unless people like you and 
I align our purpose to lend 
a helping hand. 

Perhaps we are the mir-
acle they’ve been asking 
for.

Dare to dream big. You 
can become the shining 
light of hope for those in 
need. 

Life is always ready 
to reward our audacity to 
dream, our courage to ask, 
and our commitment to 
chase those dreams.

Reflecting on Jessie B. 
Rittenhouse’s poem: Are 
we asking life for a penny 
or a wealth of experiences, 
opportunities and joy?

Toby Moore is a col-
umnist, the star of Em-
my-nominated “A Separate 
Peace,” and the CEO of 
Cubestream Inc.

Life is what you ask of it

TOBY MOORE

Positively       
Speaking

To be featured  on this page please contact Warren Dews at 413-212-0130.

SOUTH BETHLEHEM
UNITED METHODIST CHURCH

67 Willowbrook Ave
PO Box 98; South Bethlehem, NY 12161
PH# (518)767-9953   FX# (518)767-2189

Pastor Noel John
PH#(518)209-6635

Sunday Worship 11AM 
Zoom Service Available

For Link Info Please Contact:
sbumc.church@gmail.com

Fellowship immediately following 
Worship in Church Hall 

ALL ARE WELCOME

21 Main Street, Ravena, NY 12143
(518) 756-3145

Fr. Joseph O’Brien, Parochaial Vicar
Weekend Masses: Sat. Vigil 4:30 p.m., Sun. 9:30 a.m.
(also St. Patrick’s YouTube channel or Mid-Hudson 901)

Weekday Mass: Tue. 8:30 a.m.  
Also Exposition of the Blessed 

Sacrament 8:30-9 a.m. Wed., Thu.
Food Pantry Hours

Tuesdays & Fridays 10–11 a.m. 
and Wednesdays 6–7 p.m.

Thrift Shop Hours
Thursdays 1:00 – 3:00 p.m. 

Saturday from 9:00 a.m. – Noon
You Are Welcome Here!

Church Of
Saint Patrick

16 Hillcrest Dr
Ravena, NY 12143 – (518) 756-6688

Rev. Kim Krause

SUNDAY
9:30am Worship Service

TUESDAY & SATURDAY
9:00am-Noon 
Book Nook & Bargain Shed
Working together to put our faith and 
love into practice.

House of Worship - News & Services

To be featured on this page please contact Warren Dews at 413-212-0130.

Riverview Missionary
Baptist Church

“The Church at Riverview”
11 Riverview Drive, 

Coeymans, NY 12045
(518) 756-2018

www.riverviewchurchcoeymans.com
Rev. Antonio Booth & 

Rev. Dr. Roxanne Jones Booth
Co-Pastors

“Being God’s family: loving, 
caring, supporting and 

encouraging one another”
• Sunday Bible School 9:30 AM
• Sunday Morning Worship 11:00 AM
• 2nd Tuesday of the Month - Prayer	
 	 Meeting 6:30 PM - 7:30 PM
• Wednesday Bible Study 
	 6:30 PM - 8:00PM

Grace United
Methodist Church

16 Hillcrest Dr
Ravena, NY 12143

(518) 756-6688
Rev. Kim Krause

SUNDAY
9:30 AM Worship Service

TUESDAY 
& SATURDAY
9:00 AM - Noon
Book Nook & Bargain Shed
Working together to put our 
faith and love into practice.

New Baltimore
Reformed Church

Telephone: 756-8764
Rt. 144 and Church St.
NBRChurch@aol.com

www.nbrchurch.org

Rev Rick L. Behan
• Sunday Worship - 9:30 AM
• Fellowship before and after worship
• Sunday school time TBD
• Choir Thursday - 4:45 PM
• Bible Study Friday - 10:00 AM
• Helping Hands 
	 2nd Sunday - 10:30 AM

Working together since 1833

Church Of
Saint Patrick

21 Main Street,
Ravena, NY 12143

(518) 756-3145
Fr. Joseph O’Brien, 

Parochaial Vicar
Weekend Masses: Sat. Vigil 4:30 

p.m., Sun. 9:30 a.m. (also St. Patrick’s 
YouTube channel or Mid-Hudson 901)

Weekday Mass: Tue. 8:30 a.m.
Also Exposition of the Blessed

Sacrament 8:30-9 a.m. Wed., Thu.
Food Pantry Hours

Tuesdays & Fridays 10-11 a.m.
and Wednesday 6-7 p.m.

Thrift Shop Hours
Thursdays 1:00 - 3:00 p.m.

Saturday from 9:00 a.m. - Noon
You Are Welcome Here!

SOUTH BETHLEHEM
UNITED METHODIST 

CHURCH

67 Willowbrook Ave, PO Box 98; 
South Bethlehem, NY 12161

PH# (518) 767-9953
FX# (518) 767-2189
Pastor Noel John

PH# (518) 209-6635
Sunday Worship 11AM
Zoom Service Available

For Link Info Please Contact:
sbumc.church@gmail.com

Fellowship immediately following 
Worship in Church Hall

ALL ARE WELCOME

Enter to WIN Groceries at TheUpStater.com/contests-giveaways!

Contributed photo    
Traffic safety equipment purchased with an $1,800 grant awarded to the town of New Baltimore.

NEW BALTIMORE 
— The town of New Bal-
timore recently received 
a traffic safety grant from 
Cornell Local Roads in 
the form of $1,800 in traf-
fic safety equipment.

The grant means the 
equipment was purchased 
at no cost to taxpayers, 
according to Highway 
Superintendent Alan Van-
Wormer.

VanWormer applied 

for the grant about one 
year ago along with many 
other towns from through-
out New York state. 

The towns of New 
Baltimore and Greenville 
were both selected to be 
awarded the grant. 

Funds from the grant 
were used to pay for safe-
ty equipment including 20 
orange cones; six work 
zone signs; two signs each 
reading “One Lane Road 

Ahead,” “Road Work 
Ahead” and the flag  sym-
bol, including stands; two 
stop/slow paddles; two 
safety vests; two hard 
hats; two safety whistles; 
and two flagger safety 
guides. 

“Employee safety is al-
ways our number one pri-
ority at the town of New 
Baltimore,” VanWormer 
said.

Grant pays for traffic 
safety equipment 
in New Baltimore

If you’d like to 
advertise here 
please contact:

Amy Filiault
amy.filiault@

nyvtmedia

IN OUR

BACK-
YARD
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HOURS: M-F: 10A - 5P / SAT: 10A - 3P / SUN: CLOSED
Only taking drop offs - bring in your empties, place them in a 

designated area, we take your name and then give you the earliest 
time frame to come back or any time thereafter to collect your 
money. You can also donate to over 50 different organizations!

WE ACCEPT ALL N.Y. 
STATE DEPOSITS

Shane DeCrescenzo

Just Makes Cents
Bottle & Can Redemption Center • 2381 Rt 9W, Ravena, NY 12140

518-577-3084 • Justmakescents6@gmail.com

TCI NY provides an essential 
service to New Yorkers

Processing, recycling, and repairing transformers

TCI of NY is deemed an essential business in New York for its 
role in the power industry.  The company goes to the utilities with 
specialized trailers to pick up damaged or broken transformers to 
be inspected.  They are either repaired or recycled.  99 percent of 
the material processed is salvaged for beneficial re-use rather than 
landfilled.

“The service is especially important today due to severe storms 
knocking out transformers.  This has resulted in supply chain issues 
for the utilities,” said John Hamor, Capital Energy Partners.  “TCI 
removes the damaged transformers so they can be replaced or 
repaired.”

Transformers move electricity from higher to lower voltages so it can 
be delivered safely to homes, schools, and businesses.  Everything 
related to electricity uses a transformer.

To find out more about working at TCI, please email 
HR@tci-ny.com or go to www.tci-ny.com for more information.

TECHNOLOGY
TECHNOLOGY

MODERNMODERN
CLEANING
CLEANING

STOP BY & TRY ALL OUR NEW SERVICES

UNIVERSAL CAR WASH
2447 US-9W
RAVENA, NY

12 GARLAND LANE
GREENVILLE, NY

11831 RTE 9W
COXSACKIE, NY

3 CONVENIENT LOCATIONS!

• i5 Baywash 
 Hybrid Automatic

• Typhoon Touch 
Free Automatic 

• New Self Serve 
 Wash Bays 
 $5 for 8 minutes

• LED Light Show 
 At Night!

Ez Pass Unlimited Wash 
Packages & Gift Cards Now On 
Sale At Our Coxsackie Location

518-378-0164
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Melanie Lekocevic/Capital Region Independent Media    
LEFT: The poem “Who Walks with God?” by Norma June. RIGHT: A News & Views column written by Norma 
“Murt Emmet” June that was published in the Aug. 22, 2002 issue of the Ravena News-Herald, and featuring 
her trademark lion sketch.

By Norma June
“Who watches eagles and hawks as 

they soar,
Or clouds in a blue summer sky?
Who watches waves, splashing soft 

on the shore, 
Or a stream bubbling solemnly by?

Who hears the mice in the shocks of 
dry corn

As the wind in the night drives the 
cold;

And who thrills anew when the 
Spring lambs are born,

And the ewes bring them into the 
fold?

Who watches robins with fragments 
of grass

Weave nests to be cradles for young;

And how watches Spring as the win-
ter months pass,

And the green from the brown mead-
ows sprung?

Who watches seed being sown in the 
earth;

And who reaps their harvest at last?
Who learns to know what a good 

friend is worth,
A comrade both loyal and fast?

Who lives today and tomorrow with 
grace,

Yet remembers the path he has trod?
He fears not the future nor what he 

may face,
For his hand is clasped firmly by God.

~ Norma Luce June

EDITOR’S NOTE: Norma June was a columnist for the Ravena News-Herald for more than 50 years, penning two columns, “News and Views” and “News from 
the Fourth Estate,” under the pen name Murt Emmet. She retired from writing several years ago and now lives at the FASNY Firemen’s Home in Hudson.

June was honored this weekend for her work in the community, including a half century of volunteering with both the fire police at the Selkirk Fire Department and 
as an EMT with Delmar-Bethlehem EMS. We want to honor Norma’s contributions to the News-Herald with a look at some of her work through the years. We hope 
you enjoy this trip down memory lane with our beloved Murt Emmet

Norma June’s savvy writing was not 
limited to her columns. She was a pro-
lific writer of poetry and her work was 
published as a small volume of poetry by 
Bleezarde Publishing, the former owner 
of the Ravena News-Herald. Here is one 
of her works:

“The River of Legend and Lore”
By Norma Luce June

The stretch of the mighty river
From the hills to the rolling sea
Holds the ghosts of a people’s legends

And the things that they claim to be.
From the quest of the Headless 

Horseman
As he rides through the autumn night,
To the slave in the President’s man-

sion
Whose kitchen is sheer delight;

And the windless cruise on the Hud-
son

Of the vessel against the tide;
These are part of the stories and leg-

ends
That no one has ever denied.

For the ghosts and the spooks of the 
Valley

All are part of the Hudson’s lore,
And the wind howls mysterious 

warnings
As it did in the days of yore.
For this is the magical Hudson,
And down through its current and 

tides,
Through the myths and the tales and 

the legends
The mystical entity hides.

It defies all the lines and the bound-

aries
That are mapped by the ranks of the 

law,
And it rules in magnificent silence
While we watch and behold it with 

awe.
For this is the Hudson of legend, 
Which those who respect it may 

claim,
And the ghosts of a thousand old 

mem’ries
Return at the call of her name.

Melanie Lekocevic/Capital Region Independent Media    
LEFT: A publication of works written by Norma June and published by Bleezarde Publishing, the former owner of the Ravena News-Herald. CENTER: “The River of Legend and Lore,” a poem by Norma June. RIGHT: Former 
Ravena News-Herald columnist Norma June at her bench dedication at Henry Hudson Park in Selkirk on Saturday.

Poetry: A tribute to the mighty Hudson River

SELKIRK — Columnist Norma June, 
who wrote under the pen name Murt Em-
met, wrote for the Ravena News-Herald 
for more than 50 years. Here is a reprint 
of her column that ran on page 3 in the 
May 5, 1967 issue, recounting the go-
ings-on of the day.

Last week I told you that my cat, 
“Maisie,” named after the famous and 
all-inclusive receiver of the weekly let-
ters, was the proud mama of five love-
ly kittens, born the previous Sunday. 
The result of that information appearing 
in the column was a phone call from a 
mischievous friend offering to take the 
kittens off my hands to use to feed a py-
thon. He was only joking, but was highly 

amused at my appalled reaction (as he 
darn well knew I would be, which is why 
he did it!).

Also, we are not appalled, but cer-
tainly a bit disappointed, to discover 
that over the weekend some youngster 
or youngsters broke several windows 
in the Selkirk School, which is now the 
Board of Education building. I counted 
thirty-four homes of various sizes, and 
several cracks. Bethlehem Police were 
called to survey the extent of the vandal-
ism, which was gone over by the person-
nel at the building, including Superinten-
dent Virgil Tompkins.

A star-like satellite was spotted trav-
elling in a west to east course across the 
heavens around 8:45 Monday evening. 

Hank Phillips brought it to my attention, 
and we and the kids watched it for sever-
al minutes as it made its steady journey 
through the night sky.

The boys of the Cub Scout Webelos 
den took a four-mile hike with their adult 
leaders on Saturday afternoon down 
around Shad Island in the Hudson River 
near the Castleton bridge. They saw the 
tide moving swiftly, like a stream, out of 
the inlet, and crossed the bridge over to 
the island itself. They saw two dead deer, 
one apparently torn apart by dogs during 
the winter, and another one, without 
signs of violence, which had apparently 
died of natural causes within the past two 
weeks. The boys enjoyed the hike, as did 
their leaders, for it was a beautiful day. 
Afterwards they were served cake and 
soda pop by Mrs. Peter Mortenson, at 
whose home the hike began and ended.

A goodly number of people came 
to look over the new ambulance of the 
Bethlehem Volunteer Ambulance Ser-
vice, Inc., which was on display to the 
public at an Open House at the Selkirk 
#1 firehouse Sunday afternoon. Besides 
local people, Bethlehem Town Super-
visor Bertram Kohinke came to see the 
new vehicle, as did three members of the 
Ravena Hose Company Rescue Squad. 
Coffee and cookies were served.

The ambulance will be stationed at 
Glenmont next week beginning at 1:00 
p.m. this Sunday. The number to call at 
all times, regardless of duty station is 
HE9-2204.

The First Aid course is coming along 
well. For those who wish to take the Re-
fresher Course for certificate renewal 
or just for their own information, it will 
begin on Monday evening, May 15. The 
time is 7:30 to 9:30, and the place is the 
Selkirk #1 firehall on Maple Ave. in Sel-
kirk. Instructors are Charles Wickham 
and Lou Hauf. All people from surround-

ing areas and rescue squads are cordially 
invited to take advantage of this training 
opportunity.

Here’s a rather odd story, told to me 
the other day. It seems that last Sunday 
afternoon Ellen and Charlie Miller were 
having the Seaburg brothers cut down 
two of their huge old apple trees that are 
probably over a hundred years old, and 
quite tall, for apple trees. They were also 
hollow inside. The cuts were made, and 
guy ropes were attached to pull the trees 
down. As one of the trees started to come 
down a large cat jumped from the top 
clear to the ground and took off for parts 
unknown. The trees were downed and 
the task of sawing them up began. When 
the fellows stopped to rest, Bruce Miller 
remarked that he heard kittens mewing. 
He traced the sound to one of the trees 
lying on the ground, dug down inside the 
rotted part, and found three tiny kittens 
in a sort of nest in the hollow tree. Their 
eyes were open, but they were wobbly on 
their feet and estimated to be about two 
weeks old. The mother, who perhaps pic-
tured herself a bird or a squirrel, didn’t 
return to her kittens, and Ellen is feed-
ing the litter with an eyedropper. There 
are males and a female. One is tiger, one 
black, and one black with brown on its 
face, which Ellen described as being “so 
homely that it’s cute.”

Ellen would like very much to find 
homes for these little orphans as soon as 
she has gotten them to the point where 
they will drink by themselves from a 
dish. Anyone interested in adopting one 
of these little kittens? Her number is 
RO7-XXXX (phone number deleted) in 
case anyone wants a kitten for a pet.

The weather looks promising, and 
May is a lovely month.

Keep  your powder dry.
As ever,
Murt Emmet

Melanie Lekocevic/Capital Region Independent Media    
A “Murt Emmet” column — the pen name for Selkirk columnist Norma June — from the May 6, 1967 issue of 
the Ravena News-Herald, then known as The News-Herald.

REPRINT: A Norma June column from 1967

Poem: 
‘Who Walks With God?”
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13640 US RT 9W
HANNACROIX, NY
WWW.CA-ALBRIGHT.COM 518-756-3127

EXALT
The Exalt Heat Only Floor 
Standing comes loaded 
with features such as: 

• Caleffi 548 Series Separator, 
• iAssist Wi-Fi connectivity 
• All stainless steel fire tube   
 heat exchanger.

HEAT ONLY FLOOR STANDING

CTRLMAX Control System-EZ Setup 
allows for a quick :60 second setup. 

Easy troubleshooting in plain text, 
no codes. The 3-in-1 Universal vent 

adapter directly accepts PVC, 
Polypropylene, and Stainless Steel. Sizes 
are available in 110, 155, 199 MBH and 

can be cascaded up to six boilers.

BUILDING  
BETTER BY 
BUILDING  
TOGETHER.

Building toward a sustainable future starts by building better today. 
Lafarge has become Holcim US to help make this future possible.

While the name is new, you can trust us to continue providing 
sustainable building material solutions under the Holcim brand. 
We’ll also continue to invest in and play an important role in the 
communities we serve. Because together, we can build a brighter, 
more sustainable future for everyone.

#FollowUsForward

A LEADER IN INNOVATIVE AND 
SUSTAINABLE BUILDING SOLUTIONS.

To Learn More & To 
Register Please Contact:
Amy Filiault
Regional Advertising Executive
413.652.2934
amy.filiault@nyvtmedia.com

https://nyvtmedia.com/digital-webinar-july2023/

Stay 
Connected 

to Your 
Customers.

Learn how to engage with your customers 
online, why it is more important than ever, 
and tips for how you can connect with your 

audience in an easy and engaging way.

RESERVE YOUR SPOT TODAY & RECEIVE 
A FREE DIGITAL HEALTH CHECK!

 Join host Katherine Haine, President & CEO 
of City Media Inc., as she walks you though how 
to engage with your customers online.
 In this webinar, learn how your Digital 
Footprint can help you reach more customers 
online. We will provide practical tips and 
tricks to use reviews, social media and digital 
advertising to create meaningful engagement 
with your customers and community. We begin 
with the end in mind. Think about what action 
do you want your clients to take? Buy more? 
Call you? Learn how to help them do that.

Wednesday, July 19, 2023 • 12pm - 1pm EST
Bethlehem Library, Bethlehem & Via Zoom

Proudly Presented By:

OR Scan 
The QR Code

GOOGLE & SEO ONLINE ENGAGEMENT

SOCIAL MEDIA STRATEGY RISE ABOVE COMPETITION

ENGAGE WITH CONTENT NAVIGATE REVIEWS



Calendar

JULY 2023
13 -	 Coeymans Town Board meeting, 6 p.m., at Town Hall, 18 Russell Avenue, Ravena.
15 -	 Capital Region Bicycle Club Road Race, 9 a.m., at RCS High School. Race route follows local roads in 

Coeymans, Ravena and Selkirk.
16 -	 140th Anniversary of Callanan Industries, 11 a.m., Route 101, Selkirk. 
	 Quarry tours, kids’ activities. Free admission.
18 -	 Ravena Village Board meeting, 6 p.m., at Village Hall, 15 Mountain Road, Ravena.
19 -	 Evening on the Green Concert, 6 p.m., at Coeymans Landing. Sugarskull will perform.
25 -	 Ravena Village Board workshop, 6 p.m., at Village Hall, 15 Mountain Road, Ravena.
26 -	 Coeymans Planning/Zoning Board of Appeals meeting, 7 p.m., at Town Hall, 18 Russell Avenue, Ravena.
26 -	 Evening on the Green Concert, 6 p.m., at Coeymans Landing. The Rockin’ Johnsons will perform.
27 -	 Coeymans Town Board meeting, 6 p.m., at Town Hall, 18 Russell Avenue, Ravena.

AUGUST 2023
1 -	 Ravena Village Board meeting, 6 p.m., at Village Hall, 15 Mountain Road, Ravena. 
2 -	 Evening on the Green Conert, 6 p.m., at Coeymans Landing. Don & Company will perform.
10 -	 Coeymans Town Board meeting, 6 p.m., at Town Hall, 18 Russell Avenue, Ravena.
14 -	 Coeymans Planning/Zoning Board of Appeals, 7 p.m., at Town Hall, 18 Russell Avenue, Ravena.
15 -	 Ravena Village Board meeting, 6 p.m., at Village Hall, 15 Mountain Road, Ravena.
16 -	 Evening on the Green Concert, 6 p.m., at Coeymans Landing. Sugarskull will perform.
22 -	 Ravena Village Board workshop, 6 p.m., at Village Hall, 15 Mountain Road, Ravena.
23 -	 Evening on the Green Concert, 6 p.m., at Coeymans Landing. Off the Record Trio will perform.
23 -	 Coeymans Planning/Zoning Board of Appeals, 7 p.m., at Town Hall, 18 Russell Avenue, Ravena.
24 -	 Coeymans Town Board meeting, 6 p.m., at Town Hall, 18 Russell Avenue, Ravena.
26 -	 Friendship Festival, all day, at Mosher Park, Ravena. Free admission.
30 -	 Evening on the Green Concert, 6 p.m., at Coeymans Landing. Playing with Fire Band will perform.

CommunityCalendarCalendar
Ravena
Community Bulletin Board
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www.sevenzocks.com

• PROFESSIONAL SERVICE • GREAT PRICES • FULLY INSURED 
518-635-4111 • 1277 Rte 9W, Selkirk (2 miles south of Jericho Drive-In)

• Tree Trimming 
and Pruning
• Large Tree 

Removal
• 60ft Bucket Truck

• Free Estimates

Conveniently Located: 13199 Rt. 9W • Hannacroix, NY

756-3530

TAYLORS 
MONUMENT CO. INC.

• Monuments • Markers 
• Cemetery Lettering 
• Memorial Cleaning

UPSTATE FINEST ELECTRIC

518-248-4460
SHANNONLOVERIDGE01@GMAIL.COM

SHANNON LOVERIDGE
EXPERIENCED MASTER ELECTRICIAN

FULLY INSURED • HOME ADVISOR 
SERVICING WASHINGTON COUNTY, ALBANY, TROY, 

COLUMBIA COUNTY, SCHENECTADY, S. GLENS FALLS

Call Today 518.528.0144
challacombeconstruction@gmail.com

Challacombe Spray Foam

www.ChallacombeConstruction.com

Providing Kitchen and Bathroom 
Remodels and Spray Foam Applications

OUTDOOR SUPPLIES
11779 St. Route 9W, 

W.Coxsackie, NY 12192
518-731-3900

EXCAVATING
325 Medway-Earlton Rd.

Earlton, NY. 12058
518-731-6190

Halsted 
Companies

“Four Generations and 
Over One Century of Service 

to Our Community”

19 Pulver Avenue • Ravena, NY 12143

518-756-8333
PRE-PLANNING AVAILABLE
HANDICAPPED ACCESSIBLE

Dignified 
Personal Services

WWW.BABCOCKFUNERALHOMEINC.COM

local news
YOU NEED & TRUST
ALL IN ONE PLACE!

FULL SERVICE 
AUTOMOTIVE REPAIR SHOP

- 28 Years in Business -

AAA Approved Auto Repair 
NAPA Auto Care Member

• Alignments 
• NYS Inspections
• Transmissions
• Brakes
• Engine Overhauls

• Fuel Injection
• Computer Diagnosis
• Electrical
• Suspension & More
• We Even Sell Tires!

Deep Steam Extraction
For your carpets, upholstery, 

vehicle, & office!

518.756.2669
Raymond Magee - Owner

Brightway 
Cleaning Service

Cartaway, LLC is located in Glenmont, NY

518-439-0533

Dumpster Rentals Made Easy!
Commercial & Residential

• Construction • Demolition • Roofing • Clean-Out Work



CLUES ACROSS
1.	 Database 
	 management system
5.	 Medical procedures
11.	 __ Clapton, musician
12.	 Defender
16.	 Exert oneself

17.	 Indicates position
18.	 Prevents river overflow
19.	 Atrocities
24.	 Mister
25.	 Ends
26.	 Slope or tilt
27.	 Taxi

28.	 The very ends
29.	 Actor Sean
30.	 Japanese persimmon
31.	 Sours
33.	 Beneficiary
34.	 Baseball official
38.	 Muddy, boggy ground

39.	 Not worldly
40.	Actress Lathan
43.	 Soil
44.	__-Cola
45.	Asleep
49.	 __ Angeles
50.	Give birth to a child
51.	 Beach shelter
53.	 Commercial
54.	Taste property
56.	 Local jurisdictions
58.	 It cools your home
59.	 Dismounted 
	 from a horse
60.	Charge with a crime
63.	 Close in
64.	Spoke
65.	 Famed garden

CLUES DOWN
1.	 Draw a scene
2.	 Its sultan is famous
3.	 Unlucky accident
4.	 A way to ski
5.	 Abba __, Israeli 		
	 politician
6.	 Saw
7.	 “Westworld” actor 		
	 Harris
8.	 Belonging to me
9.	 Shoelace tube
10.	 Takes to court
13.	 Early multimedia
14.	 In a way, produces
15.	 Bowlers
20.	 Of I
21.	 Equally
22.	 Gets some sun

23.	 A place to stay
27.	 Town in Galilee
29.	 Aronofsky film
30.	 Klingon character, 		
	 “Star Trek”
31.	 Equal to 100 
	 square meters
32.	 Atomic #58
33.	 Arrived extinct
34.	 Loosen grip
35.	 A distinctive odor that 		
	 is unpleasant
36.	 Membranes
37.	 Some is poisonous
38.	 Partner to Pa
40.	Small brown gray rail
41.	 A salt or ester 

	 of acetic acid
42.	 Sodium
44.	Military official (abbr.)
45.	Lighted
46.	Took off
47.	 All
48.	Ohio city
50.	More abject
51.	 A radio band
52.	 Controversial tech 		
	 product (abbr.)
54.	Monetary unit
55.	 Passed with flying colors
57.	 A way to win a 
	 boxing match
61.	 The Golden State
62.	 Home of the Longhorns

Kids Page
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We Care About 
Our Community!
99 Coeymans Industrial 

Park Lane • Coeymans, NY 
Call Today 518-756-9997

Kids Corner is Sponsored By:

THIS WEEK IN...

We Care About 
Our Community!
99 Coeymans Industrial 

Park Lane • Coeymans, NY 
Call Today 518-756-9997

Kids Corner is Sponsored By:

THIS WEEK IN...

We Care About 
Our Community!
99 Coeymans Industrial 

Park Lane • Coeymans, NY 
Call Today 518-756-9997

Kids Corner is Sponsored By:

THIS WEEK IN...



Why continue to overpay? Call Nolan today!
2477 Rte 9W • Ravena, NY
www.nolanpropane.com 518-756-2010
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YOUR LOCAL FUNERAL HOME FOR 60 YEARS!

741 DELAWARE AVENUE, DELMAR, NY 12054

(518) 439-5560
WWW.MEYERSFUNERALHOME.COM

A family owned funeral home, started in 1968 by 
Ben Meyers of Alcove. In recent years taken over by 

his son, Stephen; who lives in Ravena. 

For personal service, flexibility and cost savings on 
your cremation and burial needs. Just 13 miles from 
downtown Ravena. I know people do not like to talk 
to the tax man or funeral director, but if I can be of 

any help at the time of need, please feel free to call.  

Stephen Meyers - Where the name on the sign out 
front matches the guy you talk to.

Burials starting at $2,835
Cremations starting at $995

Now Accepting New Patients!

Acupuncture is a Traditional Chinese
Medicine practice that involves inserting
thin needles into specific points on the

body. It is used to treat a variety of
conditions including pain, nausea, anxiety,

and depression.

20 Country Estates Rd, Greenville NY

<<< SCAN TO BOOK
Or call or text 518-860-9555



By Melanie Lekocevic
Capital Region 

Independent Media
With summer in full 

swing, getting out and 
about in the great out-
doors may be just what 
you are looking for.

And there’s plenty to 
explore when it comes to 
hiking and getting back 
in touch with nature right 
here in our backyard.

Albany County offers 
a plethora of outdoor ad-
ventures for nature enthu-
siasts. From lush forests 
to panoramic vistas, the 
county is home to an array 
of hiking trails that cater 
to hikers of all skill lev-
els. Whether you’re a sea-
soned hiker or a beginner 
looking for a refreshing 
getaway, Albany County’s 
hiking trails are sure to 
captivate you. 

Here are some of the 
area’s top hiking trails that 
showcase New York’s nat-
ural beauty:

• Thacher State Park: 
Located about 20 miles 
from Coeymans, Thacher 
State Park is a haven for 
outdoor enthusiasts. With 
over 25 miles of trails, 

this park offers a diverse 
range of experiences. The 
Indian Ladder Trail is a 
must-visit, taking hik-
ers on a scenic journey 
along limestone cliffs and 
breathtaking waterfalls. 
The trail also provides 
an opportunity to explore 
the awe-inspiring un-
derground beauty of the 
park’s cave system.

• Five Rivers Environ-
mental Education Center: 
For those seeking a more 
educational hiking expe-
rience, the Five Rivers 
Environmental Education 
Center is the ideal destina-
tion. With over 450 acres 
of forests, fields and wet-
lands, this center offers an 
extensive trail network. 
The trails are well-marked 
and include interpretive 
signs, providing insights 
into the surrounding flora 
and fauna. From peace-
ful walks to birdwatching 
opportunities, Five Rivers 
is a gem for nature enthu-
siasts and also offers pro-
gramming for kids look-
ing to learn about nature.

• Albany Pine Bush 
Preserve: A unique and 

rare ecosystem, the Al-
bany Pine Bush Preserve 
is home to several hik-
ing trails that offer an 
immersive experience 
in this distinctive inland 
pine barrens. The trails 
wind through rolling sand 
dunes, scrub oak forests 
and open fields, show-
casing the preserve’s bio-
diversity. The Blueberry 
Hill West Trail is a pop-
ular choice, providing 
panoramic views of the 
preserve and an opportu-
nity to spot rare species of 
plants and animals.

• Peebles Island State 
Park: Situated at the con-
fluence of the Hudson and 
Mohawk rivers, Peebles 
Island State Park offers a 
tranquil escape. The park 
boasts picturesque trails 
that meander through di-
verse habitats, including 
woodlands, wetlands and 
riverbanks. Hikers can 
explore the island’s rich 
history by visiting the re-
mains of a historic canal 
lock and enjoying scenic 
views of the rivers.

• Huyck Preserve and 
Biological Research Sta-

tion: Located in Rens-
selaerville, the Huyck 
Preserve and Biological 
Research Station is a na-
ture lover’s paradise. The 
preserve features an ex-
tensive network of trails 
that traverse forests, wet-
lands and the serene Lake 
Myosotis. Hikers can en-
joy the beauty of water-
falls, listen to the sounds 
of birdsong, and observe 

a variety of wildlife. The 
popular High Falls Trail 
rewards hikers with a 
magnificent view of the 
80-foot waterfall cascad-
ing into a deep gorge.

Whether you’re seek-
ing breathtaking vistas, 
tranquil forests or unique 
ecosystems, the county 
has something to offer ev-
ery hiker. From the lime-
stone cliffs of Thacher 

State Park to the serene 
beauty of Peebles Island 
State Park, each trail pres-
ents a chance to reconnect 
with nature and immerse 
yourself in the great out-
doors. 

Always keep safety 
in mind when hiking and 
use appropriate gear and 
footwear, hiking experts 
advise.
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Courtesy of Flickr/Thacher State Park
The Indian Ladder Trail at Thacher State Park is one of many options to go hiking in Albany County.

Exploring the natural gems: Hiking trails in Albany County

The Clematis Garden 
Club, which covers Alba-
ny, Greene and Schoharie 
counties, has selected the 
beautiful gardens of Bar-
bara Valicenti, on Route 
81 in Greenville, as the 
Garden of the Month.

Valicenti purchased 
her home in 1991. The 
original portion of her 
home was built in 1802 
and was part of the King 
George land patent of the 
Prevost Manor House 
homestead. 

Valicenti has main-

tained the original char-
acter of the home, along 
with the additional rooms 
that were added in the 
1920s.

She calls her landscape 
“mountain goat country,” 
including beautiful lo-
cust trees that are origi-
nal to the Greenville area 
shading the gardens and 
terraced paths. There are 
sitting areas featuring the 
different levels around her 
home. 

The gardens are filled 
with countless numbers of 

beautiful perennials and 
ground covers. 

Valicenti has also built 
a covered gazebo to sit 
and take in the cavernous 
view of the flowing Basic 
Creek.

The Clematis Garden 
Club, based in Green-
ville, has members from 
Greene, Albany and Scho-
harie counties, and meets 
the third Friday of the 
month at the American 
Legion Hall on Maple Av-
enue in Greenville. Guests 
are always welcome.

Club selects Garden of the Month



By Thomas Christopher
For Capital Region

 Independent Media
Back in late April, I 

attended an Earth Day 
celebration where I met 
a thoroughly remarkable 
woman, Maya K. van Ros-
sum. Today, I’m going to 
step back from advice on 
how to cultivate your gar-
den to profile a movement 
– “Green Amendments for 
the Generations” – that 
she is leading. 

This movement, I pre-

dict, will have a hugely 
positive impact not only 
on your personal land-
scape but also on count-
less other aspects of your 
daily life.

An attorney based in 
Pennsylvania, van Ros-
sum has served since 1994 
as the Delaware River-
keeper. As she explained 
to me, that means she is 
responsible for coordi-
nating a network of advo-
cates who guard the health 

of that river, which drains 
13,539 square miles in the 
states of Pennsylvania, 
New Jersey, Delaware and 
New York.  

A principal threat that 
van Rossum and her col-
leagues have confronted 
is the environmental dev-
astation caused by frack-
ing. They had succeeded 
in securing a temporary 
ban on fracking within 
the watershed by 2012 
when the fracking indus-
try struck back. Working 
behind closed doors, in-
dustry leaders assembled 
a bill (“Act 13”) that 
would greatly loosen pub-
lic control of their activi-
ties in Pennsylvania and 
succeeded in pushing this 
through the state legisla-
ture and getting it signed 
by the governor.

Because of its tem-
porary fracking ban, this 
new law wouldn’t have 
immediately affected 
the Delaware watershed, 
but van Rossum takes an 
ecosystem-wide view of 
environmental protection. 
She discovered that the 
Pennsylvania state con-
stitution included a clause 
in its Bill of Rights sec-
tion, which affirmed that 
residents had a right to 
pure water, clean air and 
a healthy environment. 
Joining with seven mu-
nicipalities that were con-
cerned that the new law 
deprived local communi-
ties of the right to regulate 
fracking within their bor-
ders, the Delaware River-

keeper Network brought 
a suit before the Penn-
sylvania Supreme Court 
that charged Act 13 with 
violating the state’s Bill 
of Rights. In December of 
2013, the plaintiffs won.

Maya van Rossum 
pointed out to me in a 
conversation last May 
that most existing envi-
ronmental regulations, 
including the landmark 
Clean Water and Clean Air 
Acts of the 1970s, essen-
tially took ongoing pol-
lution and environmental 
degradation for granted. 
All these laws did was to 
regulate how and to what 
extent these harms would 
be permitted. 

Her experience with 
Act 13 suggested that the 
language in Pennsylva-
nia’s Bill of Rights was 
a far more powerful tool 
for protecting the environ-
ment. When van Rossum 
checked, however, she 
found that Montana was 
the only other state with a 
similar guarantee. She re-
solved to change that.

First, she wrote a book, 
“The Green Amendment: 
Securing Our Right to A 
Healthy Environment.” 
Published in 2017, this 
volume detailed the dev-
astating experiences 
homeowners have had 
with fracking and its con-
tamination of the soil and 
poisoning of the ground-
water. She outlined the 
power for residents she 
had found in Pennsylva-
nia’s Bill of Rights and 

urged her readers to join 
in making sure that their 
state constitutions includ-
ed similar protection in 
their own states’ bill of 
rights. This book met with 
favorable reviews and in 
2018 won a Living Now 
Evergreen Awards gold 
medal as a “world-chang-
ing book.”

In 2019, van Rossum 
built on this foundation 
to create Green Amend-
ments for the Generations, 
a non-profit organization 
dedicated to promoting 
what was becoming a 
popular movement. Since 
then, she has traveled the 
country to meet with local 
environmentalists who are 
seeking to adapt the green 
amendment concept to 
suit their states. 

In 2021, New York 
state voters passed, by 
a 2-1 margin, a green 
amendment to the Bill of 
Rights in their state con-
stitution. Currently, van 
Rossum told me, Green 
Amendments for the Gen-
erations is collaborating 
with 17 other states on 
similar efforts. 

In November 2022, 
van Rossum published 
a second edition of her 
book, “The Green Amend-
ment,” which is expanded 
to include consideration 
of environmental racism, 
the climate crisis, the hu-
man health devastation 
caused by environmental 
degradation, and the im-
portance of protecting fu-
ture generations from pol-

lution and environmental 
harm. I should note that 
all profits from both edi-
tions have gone to support 
Green Amendments for 
the Generations.

To listen to my con-
versation with Maya K. 
van Rossum, log onto the 
Berkshire Botanical Gar-
den’s “Growing Greener” 
podcast at www.berk-
shirebotanic.org

Be-a-Better-Gardener 
is a community service 
of Berkshire Botanical 
Garden, located in Stock-
bridge, Mass. Its mission, 
to provide knowledge of 
gardening and the en-
vironment through a di-
verse range of classes 
and programs, informs 
and inspires thousands of 
students and visitors each 
year. Thomas Christopher 
is a volunteer at Berkshire 
Botanical Garden and is 
the author or co-author of 
more than a dozen books, 
including Nature into Art 
and The Gardens of Wave 
Hill (Timber Press, 2019). 
He is the 2021 Garden 
Club of America’s Nation-
al Medalist for Literature, 
a distinction reserved to 
recognize those who have 
left a profound and last-
ing impact on issues that 
are most important to the 
GCA. Christopher’s com-
panion broadcast to this 
column, Growing Green-
er, streams on WESUFM.
org, Pacifica Radio and 
NPR and is available at 
berkshirebotanical.org/
growinggreener.
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BE A BETTER GARDENER
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Environmentalist Maya van Rossum’s book, “The Green Amendment.”

Green Amendments for the Generations

This is a time of year 
when bears are active. 
The state’s Department of 
Environmental Conserva-
tion has issued guidelines 
to avoid black bears and 
prevent them from being 
attracted to your campsite 
or home.

Black bears are om-
nivorous, meaning they 
feed on both plants and 
animals. Their natural diet 
is composed primarily of 
vegetation, and second-
arily of insects and other 
animals. 

Bears are opportunistic 

and will eat bird seed, pet 
food and trash left outside 
or unsecured. They may 
attempt to break into or 
consume anything with an 
appealing odor including 
barbecue grills, coolers 
and toiletries.

Black bears are well 
established in New York, 
with the Catskills and 
Adirondacks having the 
highest population densi-
ties.

The DEC is encour-
aging everyone to keep 
black bears living off the 
bare necessities, and to 

practice the BearWise Ba-
sics and Safety Tips, espe-
cially when vacationing 
or recreating in bear coun-
try this summer. 

Be sure to follow the 
guidance below:

• Stay alert and togeth-
er;

• Set up camp away 
from dense cover;

• Cook as far from 
your tent as possible;

• Leave no trash or 
food scraps;

• Use bear-resistant 
food containers, which 
are required in the Eastern 

High Peaks Wilderness of 
Adirondack Park;

• Never keep food, 
coolers or scented items 
in tents or vehicles when 
camping;

• Never leave food un-
attended;

• Know what to do if 
you see a bear; and,

• Carry bear spray and 
know how to use it.

For more information 
on how to live responsi-
bly with Black Bears visit 
bearwise.org.Courtesy of Pexels    

Black bears are active this time of year, so the DEC has issued recom-
mendations to avoid attracting bears to your home or campsite.

DEC: Don’t attract bears to home or campsite

You know who isn’t 
a huge fan of summer? 
Trout! 

Summer heat waves 
impose serious stress and 
can even cause death. 
Trout and salmon that are 
already heat-stressed may 
not recover after being 
caught and released.

You can help these fish 

survive the summer by 
following a few simple 
tips.
DON’T MOVE ROCKS 

IN STREAMS
Now that summer’s 

officially here, it’s import-
ant to understand the det-
rimental impact building 
rock dams with the intent 
of creating swimming 

holes can have on trout 
streams.

Trout are sensitive, 
cold-water fish that re-
quire cold, clean water to 
survive. Water tempera-
tures warmer than 68°F 
can put extreme stress on 
trout and temperatures ap-
proaching 75°F can even 
be lethal.

ROCK DAMS
• Alter the natural flow 

of the stream by slowing 
down or trapping the wa-
ter, allowing it to warm up 
faster.

• Prevent the migration 
of trout to colder head-
waters where they can 
seek thermal refuge in the 
warm summer months, as 

well as spawning habitat 
in the spring and fall.

• Prevent upstream and 
downstream movement of 
animals, such as aquat-
ic insects — a major diet 
item for trout.

• Weaken the stream 
bank, increasing erosion 
and sedimentation into the 
stream, further altering its 

natural flow.
So, this summer if 

your favorite swimming 
hole is drying up, think 
about the trout that live 
there. Instead of building 
a rock dam, maybe go for 
a walk downstream and 
find a natural pool to cool 
off in.

Give trout a break this summer

ALBANY — Six mil-
lion dollars in grants is 
available to help commu-
nities facing environmen-
tal justice challenges and 
address environmental 
concerns. 

The latest round of En-
vironmental Justice Com-
munity Impact Grants is 
the largest amount offered 
to date and is supported by 
the state’s Environmental 

Protection Fund as part of 
New York’s ongoing ef-
forts to assist communities 
disproportionately bur-
dened by environmental 
pollution.

Community-based or-
ganizations can apply to 
receive up to $100,000 in 
funding for projects that 
address environmental 
and public health concerns 
of residents in impacted 

neighborhoods.
Eligible communi-

ty-based organizations are:
• Located in Potential 

Environmental Justice Ar-
eas;

• Groups serving the 
residents of an area equal 
to or smaller than a coun-
ty outside of New York 
City or an area equal to or 
smaller than one of New 
York City’s five boroughs; 

and
• Organizations with to-

tal annual revenue of less 
than $3 million.

Projects must address 
a community’s exposure 
to multiple environmental 
harms and risks and in-
clude a new research com-
ponent that will be used to 
expand the knowledge of 
the affected community.

Further organization 

and location eligibility re-
quirements can be found in 
the Grant Opportunity Por-
tal at www.grantsgateway.
ny.gov.

Applicants are required 
to register and pre-qualify 
in the Grants Gateway by 
the application deadline for 
their application to be con-
sidered. Once registered, 
organizations can apply for 
the grant while waiting on 

their document vault to be-
come prequalified.

The deadline to submit 
applications is 3 p.m. EST 
on July 26. For a com-
plete list of guidelines and 
more information, contact 
DEC’s Office of Environ-
mental Justice at 518-402-
8556, justice@dec.ny.gov, 
or online at DEC’s Envi-
ronmental Justice webpage 
at dec.ny.gov.

New round of Environmental Justice Community Impact Grants

Call 1-413-212-0130 or visit www.theupstater.com/contact

made you look! others will too... 
your ad could be here!HERE!

LOOK



By Melanie Lekocevic
Capital Region 

Independent Media
There’s something 

magical about firing up 
the grill and cooking de-
licious meals in the great 
outdoors. Outdoor grill-
ing brings people togeth-
er, creates unforgettable 
memories, and fills the air 

with tantalizing aromas. 
Whether you’re a sea-

soned grill master or a 
beginner, these expert tips 
will help you take your 
outdoor grilling game to 
the next level. 

• Choose the Right 
Grill: Invest in a 
high-quality grill that suits 

your needs. Options range 
from gas and charcoal 
grills to electric and pellet 
grills. Each has its advan-
tages, so consider factors 
such as convenience, fla-
vor and temperature con-
trol before making your 
selection.

• Preparing the Grill: 

Cleanliness is key. Re-
move any remnants from 
previous grilling sessions. 
For gas grills, check the 
propane tank, hoses, and 
connections for leaks or 
damages. With charcoal 
grills, ensure the vents are 
open and the charcoal is 
evenly distributed.

• Essential Grilling 
Tools: Having the right 
tools will make your grill-
ing experience smoother. 
Stock up on long-handled 
tongs, spatulas, basting 
brushes, a meat thermom-
eter and grill brushes for 
proper cleaning.

• Preheat for Success: 
Preheating your grill is 
crucial for ensuring even 
cooking. For gas grills, 
preheat for 10-15 minutes 
with the lid closed. For 
charcoal grills, allow the 
coals to turn white before 
placing the food on the 
grill.

• Mastering Direct and 
Indirect Heat: Direct heat 
is ideal for quick-cooking 
items like burgers, steaks 
and vegetables. Indirect 
heat is perfect for larger 

cuts of meat or delicate 
foods. Create a two-zone 
fire by piling the coals 
on one side or turning off 
burners on a gas grill. This 
allows you to control the 
cooking temperature more 
effectively.

Here is a recipe to try 
out: Grilled Lemon Gar-
lic Shrimp Skewers

Ingredients:
•	 1 pound jumbo 

shrimp, peeled and 
deveined

•	 3 cloves garlic, 
minced

•	 2 tablespoons fresh 
lemon juice

•	 2 tablespoons olive oil
•	 1 teaspoon paprika
•	 1/2 teaspoon salt
•	 1/4 teaspoon black-

pepper
•	 Fresh parsley, chopped 

(for garnish)
•	 Lemon wedges 
	 (for serving)
	 Instructions:
1.	 Preheat the grill to 

medium-high heat.
2.	 In a mixing bowl, 

combine the minced 
garlic, lemon juice, 
olive oil, paprika, salt 

and black pepper. Mix 
well to create a mari-
nade.

3.	 Add the shrimp to the 
marinade and toss un-
til well-coated. Allow 
the shrimp to marinate 
for 15-20 minutes.

4.	 Thread the shrimp 
onto skewers, ensur-
ing they are evenly 
spaced.

5.	 Place the shrimp 
skewers on the pre-
heated grill and cook 
for 2-3 minutes per 
side, or until they turn 
pink and opaque.

6.	 Remove the shrimp 
from the grill and 
garnish with fresh 
parsley.

7.	 Serve the grilled 
lemon garlic shrimp 
skewers with lemon 
wedges for an extra 
burst of citrus flavor.
So, fire up that grill, 

embrace the sizzle, and 
let your taste buds savor 
the delicious flavors of 
outdoor cooking. Happy 
grilling!

Living On Purpose

By Dr. William Holland
For Capital Region 

Independent Media
For those of you that 

reHow much grace does it 
take to love our enemies? 
That’s a good question. 

Tragedies occur all 
around us and it’s true 
we are heartbroken and 
disturbed, but how do we 
react when our family is 
harmed or we are person-
ally offended? 

I admit I do not al-
ways have the character 
of Christ when I’m being 

threatened or provoked 
to anger. Our natural re-
action is to retaliate be-
cause that’s a natural part 
of our carnal nature. Most 
of us agree people need 
to be punished for their 
evil deeds, but Christians 
must remember the temp-
tation to hold unforgive-
ness against anyone must 
be resisted. 

Yes, we will face chal-
lenges and situations that 
attempt to lure us into 
loathing attitudes, but it’s 
forgiveness and love that 

keeps us on the narrow 
way of peace and content-
ment. 

When we dwell on re-
taliation, our joy, which 
is our spiritual strength, 
evaporates and we be-
come weak and dis-
couraged. The brooding 
desire for revenge will 
emotionally, mentally 
and spiritually hold us in 
the bondage of misery. 
If we allow ourselves to 
become weighed down 
with animosity, our re-
lationship with God suf-

fers, which is why it’s so 
important to not become 
entangled with the poison 
of hatred. To those around 
us, we may seem fine, 
but on the inside, we are 
seething with contempt. 

Do you secretly have 
resentment against some-
one today? Let us remem-
ber this internal agonizing 
battle is not forced upon 
us, we decide to partic-
ipate. Our natural mind 
loves to justify corrupt at-
titudes, and if we continue 
to focus on vengeance in-
stead of asking for God’s 
help, we are allowing the 
darkness of sin to control 
and hold us hostage. 

Sadly, many would 
rather live in the agony of 
hostility instead of releas-
ing their agony to God 
and allowing Him to ex-
ecute vengeance and jus-
tice His way. 

As a chaplain, I re-
member a few years ago 
being called by a health 
care facility to pray for 
an elderly gentleman that 
was near death. He was 
barely able to understand 
or communicate because 
of the heavy doses of 
morphine. His son was 
sitting next to the bed and 
after a while, he started to 
talk about his dad. 

They were not close, 
and he began to describe 
a man that was not only 
harsh and uncaring but 

abusive. I could sense the 
deep emotional pain as he 
began to tell a sad story 
about a disappointed and 
wounded family. 

The son was a Chris-
tian and had been dealing 
with resentment for years. 
As he continued to share 
about the power of for-
giveness, I could sense 
the love and peace of God 
in his countenance. If we 
sincerely repent and ask 
the Lord to step into our 
situation, He is the only 
one who can bring true 
hope and healing to our 
hearts and minds.

When watching a tod-
dler, we notice they react 
to basic experiences of 
hunger, affection, disap-
pointment, happiness and 
anger but are only be-
ginning to learn what it 
means to be offended. Re-
sentment and bitterness 
are negative attitudes and 
it’s only through inviting 
Christ to become our Lord 
and allowing His truth 
to transform our minds 
that we can be molded 
into His way of merciful 
thinking. He wants us to 
be honest with Him and 
not suppress these ugly 
imaginations that not only 
can build a wall between 
us and the Lord, it also 
makes us toxic to those 
around us. 

Just how serious is 
unforgiveness? Matthew 

6:14-15 says, “If you for-
give those who sin against 
you, your heavenly Father 
will forgive you. But if 
you refuse to forgive oth-
ers, your Father will not 
forgive your sins.” 

Hatred is silent but 
deadly and is like a grow-
ing infection that can de-
sensitize us from having 
compassion for anyone 
or anything. Since the 
Christian’s greatest asset 
is love, the enemy of our 
soul will use anything he 
can to prevent us from 
forgiving and praying for 
others. 

May we never discard 
our responsibility to hum-
bly serve and obey Christ 
because we are blinded by 
our plans to get even with 
someone. Whatever they 
have done to hurt us, we 
have the choice to let it go 
so that we can live in the 
joy of God’s presence. 

Some may boldly de-
clare they cannot forgive 
but this is not true. For-
giveness is a choice as the 
Bible reminds us in Prov-
erbs 13:18, “Poverty and 
shame will come to those 
who refuse instruction: 
but they who embrace 
correction will be hon-
ored.”

Read more about the 
Christian life at: billyhol-
landministries.com.

Preventing seeds of unforgiveness to germinate
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Invest In Your Home’s Value
By replacing your trim and siding, you’re not only 

renewing your home’s look, but also 
adding lasting value and energy savings! 

Let the expert staff at GNH guide you through 
the many options.

*Non-stock / Special order*

Courtesy of Pexels    
It’s outdoor grilling season. Here are tips — and a recipe — to make the most of it.

Mastering the art of outdoor grilling

BIKING, BURGERS AND
BEVERAGES

 

FOLLOW THAT TRAIL

Wednesday, July 26, 5-8pm
Along the Albany Country Helderberg-Hudson Rail Trail

from Blanchard-Currey American Legion Post to The Real McCoy  

FEATURING::
Biking on the Rail Trail
Food & Beverages
Food Trucks

Skills Course
Craft and Vendors
Scavenger Hunts
Bike Show & Tell

Flow Riders Mt. Bike
Demos
Live Music
 Bike Safety Booth

Hosted by the Bethlehem Chamber of Commerce with our generous sponsors 

Hosted by the Bethlehem Chamber 
of Commerce with our generous sponsors

• Biking on the Rail Trail 
• Food & Beverages 
• Food Trucks
• Skills Course
• Craft and Vendors

• Scavenger Hunts
• Bike Show & Tell
• Flow Riders Mt. Bike Demos
• Live Music
• Bike Safety Booth

FEATURING:

Along the Albany County 
Helderberg-Hudson Rail Trail

from Blanchard-Currey American 
Legion Post to The Real McCoy

Wednesday, July 26, 5-8pm

BIKING, BURGERS AND
BEVERAGES

FOLLOW THAT TRAIL

DID YOU KNOW?
RECYCLING

1 TON OF PAPER
SAVES

17 TREES!

REDUCE
REUSE

RECYCLE



Dear Rusty: 
I am a 62-year-old 

widower that is still work-
ing full-time. 

While my late spouse 
was in hospice, I was able 
to get her to apply for So-
cial Security disability 
and she received one pay-
ment before she passed 
away two years ago. I was 
told that I could collect 
a survivor benefit, so I 

called my local Social Se-
curity office, but they told 
me that I could not collect 
any type of benefits from 
my wife and that all the 
money she paid into SS 
for all of those years was 
basically gone for good. 

Would you please ad-
vise what I can do and 
if this is true? I was also 
told that Social Security’s 
agents will do everything 
they can to avoid paying 
out benefits. 

Signed: Frustrated 
Widower

Dear Frustrated 
Widower: 

I suspect that the rea-
son Social Security said 
you were not eligible for 
benefits as a widower is 
because you are working 
full-time. 

At age 62, you are sub-
ject to Social Security’s 
“earnings test,” which 
limits how much you can 
earn while collecting early 
Social Security benefits. 
The 2023 earnings limit is 

$21,240 and, if that is ex-
ceeded, SS will take away 
$1 in benefits for every 
$2 you are over the limit. 
If your earnings are high 
enough, that could make 
you temporarily ineligible 
to collect benefits until 1) 
your earnings are less, or 
2) you reach your full re-
tirement age (FRA) when 
the earnings test no longer 
applies. 

Assuming you have 
not yet claimed your per-
sonal SS retirement bene-
fit, you are still eligible to 
collect a survivor benefit 
from your wife when your 
earnings are less or after 
you reach your full retire-
ment age. 

One strategy you may 
wish to consider, if you 
plan to keep working 
full-time, is to wait and 
claim only your surviv-
ing spouse benefit at your 
FRA (67), thus allowing 
your personal SS retire-
ment benefit to continue 
growing until you are 70 

when your personal SS 
retirement benefit will be 
about 75% more than it 
would be now. 

Although your survi-
vor benefit reaches max-
imum at your FRA, your 
personal benefit doesn’t 
reach maximum until age 
70, so it’s possible to col-
lect your smaller survivor 
benefit from your wife 
first and claim your higher 
personal benefit later. 

You were apparent-
ly given some confusing 
information when you 
contacted Social Securi-
ty. If you haven’t already 
claimed your own SS re-
tirement benefit, you are 
still eligible for a surviv-
ing spouse benefit from 
your wife but likely can-
not collect a widower ben-
efit at this time because 
you’re working full-time. 

However, that doesn’t 
mean you can never col-
lect a survivor benefit; 
only that you can’t collect 
it at this time because of 

the “earnings test.” The 
earnings test goes away 
when you reach age 67, 
so you can claim only 
your survivor benefit at 
that time (or before if you 
no longer work full-time) 
and allow your personal 
SS retirement benefit to 
continue to grow (to age 
70 if you like). 

From our experience 
with the Social Security 
Administration, the skill 
level of SSA representa-
tives varies but we have 
never suspected their goal 
was trying to avoid paying 
benefits due. 

Nevertheless, depend-
ing on the agent you spoke 
with, the information pro-
vided may have been less 
clear about the best claim-
ing strategy for you — 
which is why the AMAC 
Foundation’s Social Se-
curity Advisory Service 
exists. Our advisors are 
all highly experienced and 
strive to provide you with 
complete and clear infor-

mation that enables you to 
make an informed choice 
about how and when to 
claim the Social Security 
benefits you are entitled 
to. I hope we have suc-
ceeded.

This article is intended 
for information purposes 
only and does not rep-
resent legal or financial 
guidance. It presents the 
opinions and interpreta-
tions of the AMAC Foun-
dation’s staff, trained and 
accredited by the Nation-
al Social Security Associ-
ation (NSSA). NSSA and 
the AMAC Foundation 
and its staff are not affil-
iated with or endorsed by 
the Social Security Ad-
ministration or any other 
governmental entity. To 
submit a question, visit 
our website (amacfoun-
dation.org/programs/so-
cial-security-advisory) or 
email us at ssadvisor@
amacfoundation.org.

SOCIAL 
SECURITY 
MATTERS

RUSSELL GLOOR

Why can’t I collect survivor benefits 
from my deceased wife?
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GLENMONT – Sun-
mark Credit Union cele-
brated the grand opening 
of its branch location in 
the hamlet of Glenmont, 
designed to better serve 
the residents of Albany 
County, according to the 
company.  

The 2,000-square-foot 
branch, which opened at 
7 Moriah Road earlier this 
year, marks Sunmark’s 
16th location across the 
credit union’s 14-county 

field of membership. 
State and town officials 

were on hand to help cel-
ebrate with a ribbon-cut-
ting ceremony. Among 
those in attendance were 
state Assemblyman Scott 
Bendett, Bethlehem Town 
Councilman David De-
Cancio, and President of 
Bethlehem’s Chamber of 
Commerce, Terri Egan. 

The Glenmont branch 
is a full-service location 
equipped with interactive 

teller machines (myTMs) 
both inside and outside 
the branch. After dai-
ly operating hours, the 
two drive-up myTMs are 
available 24 hours a day, 
allowing members to con-
duct transactions on their 
schedule.

In celebration of the 
location’s grand opening, 
Sunmark is offering spe-
cials to both new and cur-
rent members who visit 
the Glenmont branch.

“Because you’re not-
for-profit you really can 
focus on your members 
and the services you pro-
vide them, and that is 
something here in Beth-

lehem and I think all over 
that we really value,” said 
Terri Egan, president of 
the Bethlehem Chamber 
of Commerce.

Lobby hours for the 
Glenmont location are 

Mondays and Tues-
days 9 a.m. to 4:30 p.m., 
Wednesdays from 10 a.m. 
to 4:30 p.m., Thursdays 
and Fridays from 9 a.m. 
to 6 p.m., and Saturdays 
from 9 a.m. to 1 p.m.

Contributed photo    
Sunmark Credit Union held a grand opening at its newest branch, in Glenmont.

Contributed photo    
Elected officials and community leaders were on hand to cut the ribbon on the new branch at 7 Moriah 
Road in Glenmont.

Sunmark Credit Union 
holds grand opening 
for Glenmont branch

ALBANY – Albany 
County Legislator Jeff S. 
Perlee (R-C, Altamont) 
recently testified on legis-
lation he introduced with 
Majority Leader Dennis A. 
Feeney (D-C, Guilderland) 
to help the Capital District 
prepare for the 250th anni-
versary celebration of the 
American Revolution in 
2026. 

The resolution would 
establish the “USA-250” 
Commission to help plan, 
develop, coordinate and 
promote activities relating 
to the War of Indepen-
dence anniversary, and the 
resulting establishment of 

our great nation.
“The 250th Anniversa-

ry of the American Revo-
lution promises to be the 
most significant commem-
oration of American histo-
ry since the bicentennial,” 
Perlee said. “Our region 
was a leader in the War 
of Independence, which 
provides us a tremendous 
opportunity to put Albany 
County and the Capital 
District at the forefront of 
this national event. I am 
hopeful this resolution will 
foster a new appreciation 
for history, support for lo-
cal historical societies, and 
drive heritage tourism and 

economic development 
throughout Albany Coun-
ty. Though 2026 may seem 
far away, it is never too 
early to start planning.” 

Albany County was 
the focal point of many 
important parts of the 
American War of Indepen-
dence and was critically 
the intended end point for 
British forces in the deci-
sive Saratoga Campaign, 
which turned the tide of 
the conflict, according to a 
statement from the county. 

The county was also 
home to many important 
leaders, political thinkers 
and other individuals who 

took part in the Ameri-
can Revolution, such as 
the Schuyler family, Peter 
Gansevoort, Abraham Ten 
Broeck, and other promi-
nent individuals.

“As Democratic Ma-
jority Leader, and as an 
American, I am proud to 
support this commission, 
which will recognize the 
significant efforts of the 
many Albany County res-
idents and Continental 
Army soldiers who worked 
and fought to support the 
13 colonies in the Revolu-
tionary War,” Feeney said. 
“Substantial numbers of 
those soldiers were Black 

and Native American peo-
ple, who came from around 
the Northeast to serve in 
the first integrated military 
units in American history, 
and who proudly served 
the Continental Army in 
battles throughout the re-
gion. I look forward to 
further exploring the con-
tributions of all those who 
worked towards, fought, 
and died for the cause of 
freedom and American in-
dependence.” 

The USA-250 Com-
mission, to be appointed 
by Albany County Exec-
utive Daniel McCoy, the 
county Legislature, and 

Discover Albany, will help 
leverage the region’s rich 
revolutionary history into 
a win for area tourism and 
economic development. 

The measure was 
passed in multiple Legisla-
tive committee meetings. 

In the coming weeks 
and months, Perlee and 
Feeney will continue to 
push for critical funds and 
actions that help promote 
the 250th anniversary of 
the American Revolution, 
as well as the region’s 
overall historical impor-
tance.

Albany County preparing for 250th 
anniversary of American Revolution
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Have you ever expe-
rienced a sharp, stabbing 
pain in your calf that was 
so deep, it woke you up? 
Or maybe you’ve had a 
craving for chocolate that 
so intense, it was all you 
could think about. 

Also known as hypo-
magnesemia, those are just 

some of the early warning 
signs that your body is in 
desperate need of magne-
sium. Often overlooked as 
a health problem, numer-
ous studies suggest that up 
to 75% of Americans are 
not meeting their recom-
mended intake of magne-
sium for various reasons 
such as excessive caffeine 
and alcohol consumption.

After oxygen, water 
and food, magnesium may 
be the most important el-
ement your body depends 
on. Necessary for more 
than 300 biochemical 
functions, magnesium is 
especially important for 
your heart, muscles and 
kidneys, regulating blood 
pressure and heartbeat 
rhythm, bone health, prop-
er vitamin D absorption 

and much more. 
According to Dr. Car-

olyn Dean, author of the 
“Magnesium Miracle,” 
“Science has shown that a 
magnesium deficiency can 
trigger or cause many dif-
ferent conditions includ-
ing unexplained fatigue 
or weakness, abnormal 
heart rhythms, rapid heart-
beat, muscle twitches, leg 
cramps, foot pain,  verti-
go, irritability, insomnia 
or migraine headaches.”  

Everyone feels fa-
tigued from time to time. 
But if you’re feeling per-
sistent fatigue that doesn’t 
get better with rest and 
quality sleep, it may be 
time to see a professional. 

Many observational 
studies have found that 
insufficient amounts of 

magnesium increase the 
odds of developing high 
blood pressure. However, 
numerous studies found 
that increasing magne-
sium can successfully 
lower blood pressure. Dr. 
Dean suggests asking your 
health care practitioner for 
an “erythrocyte magne-
sium level” or “red blood 
cell magnesium level” 
test. These tests provide 
more insight into your 
magnesium levels and are 
available from labs across 
the U.S.  

In addition to helping 
reduce the symptoms list-
ed above, magnesium also 
improves sleep, relieves 
stress, increases energy 
and improves mood. 

Luckily, getting your 
magnesium levels back on 

track isn’t all that difficult. 
“Since we don’t need 

all that much magnesium, 
a deficiency can likely be 
fixed within a few weeks,” 
Dr. Dean said. 

However, if you have 
diarrhea or some other 
malabsorption issues in 
your gut, it may take lon-
ger.  

The best way to in-
crease your body’s mag-
nesium levels is through 
proper diet. Adding mag-
nesium-rich dark green 
leafy vegetables such as 
spinach and Swiss chard 
to your diet is the opti-
mal way as both are eas-
ily absorbed by the body. 
Other great sources in-
clude pumpkin seeds, 
kefir, salmon, cashews, 
goat cheese, artichokes, 

almonds, black beans, av-
ocado, figs, dark chocolate 
and bananas 

While it’s best to get 
magnesium from food, 
magnesium supplements 
might be an option for 
some people. 

When choosing a mag-
nesium supplement, look 
for a chelated magnesium 
supplement. However, 
chelated magnesium tends 
to be a bit more expensive 
due to the complex pro-
cess required to make it. 

One final note: The in-
formation provided in this 
article is not a substitute 
for professional medical 
advice, diagnosis or treat-
ment. If you have any 
medical questions or con-
cerns, please talk to your 
health care provider.

The invisible deficiency 

MARY SCHOEPE

Concepts 
in Fitness
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To experience the un-
conditional love of a pet 
during trying times is to 
know a connection to an-

other living creature that 
is deeper than any other 
that I’ve ever known in 
the non-human world. 

It’s a relationship that 
is expressed with a sincer-
ity that transcends the spo-
ken word. Didn’t matter 
how much emotion I un-
leashed during the hardest 
of days after I had surgery, 
my little ones were there 
at my side, snuggling, giv-
ing me the connection that 
I needed to know I was 
not alone. Their actions 
said, “Go ahead and cry 
your head off and take all 
the time you need, we’re 
here!” 

That’s what “pet med-
icine” is. They knew I 
needed them to just “be 

there.” 
Oftentimes, there were 

those incredibly generous 
occasions when I was also 
offered their most pre-
cious possessions known 
as their “baby” toys that 
were dropped on my sob-
bing chest in a gesture that 
said… “Here, Momma, 
you can play with these 
until you feel better.” 

Without fail, that drew 
me right out of the depth 
of emotion and brought a 
sincere smile to my face 
that healed the wound 
that had broken open at 
that moment. My smile 
warmed their hearts and 
got their tails wagging 
exuberantly. They and I 
knew all was well, at least 

for now.
So, what is this magi-

cal elixir? The nectar that 
fuels the psychological 
need to be shown love 
without the actual words 
that might be said by an-
other, human or pet?

In my field of work, 
whereby I delve into 
what’s known as “energy 
medicine,” I’ve learned 
the power of just being 
with another as a witness 
to an experience. I’ve 
been just that… a version 
of “pet medicine.” I may 
not wag my invisible tail, 
but I definitely can show 
love and support through 
eye contact and a gesture 
that says “I’m here for 
you,” by sitting quietly 

and matching the breath-
ing pattern of the person 
I’m working with. 

Eventually, that close-
ness and the calming of 
both of our energies re-
sults in a shift of compla-
cency and trust.

This is the duality of 
being on the needing side 
of compassion and active-
ly just “being” alongside.

Obviously, our pets, 
in this case my two pups, 
came with this program 
already installed and they 
showed me how much 
they were capable of by 
helping me to get through 
a really tough time by just 
having them with me.

Of course, my grati-
tude was shown by per-

haps giving back an extra 
treat of two, which only 
tends to happen on the 
holidays.

Could this be their mo-
tivation? I doubt it, but it 
has left me wondering.

Pat Larsen is a fitness 
instructor bringing Baby 
Boomers and seniors mu-
sic and movement morn-
ings at The Shamrock 
House, in East Durham. 
She also is a certified clin-
ical hypnotherapist work-
ing in Greene County to 
uncover solutions to help 
those seeking to live their 
best life at any age. Con-
tact Pat at 518-275-8686 
or via email at pelars-
en5@aol.com, or on 
Facebook at Pat Larsen.

Pet medicine

PAT LARSEN

BODY, MIND 
& SPIRIT

SELKIRK — Bethle-
hem Grange 137 will once 
again host the annual Ga-
rage Sale Explosion this 
weekend and next week-
end.

There will be two full 
floors of items, plus tents 
of additional items in the 
back. The second floor is 
also handicap accessible.  

You name it, they prob-
ably have it. There’ss also 
lots of plants, both indoor 
and outdoor, available and 
new items are added daily. 
There will be lots of tables 
of items, both indoors and 
outdoors.

The Grange building 
has two handicap-accessi-
ble ramps. 

Only cash or checks 
are accepted for payment. 
No credit or debit cards.

This year the Grange 
is also adding something 
new to the garage sales 
— flea market vendors 
are wanted for outdoors 
during the garage sales. 
For more information 
about becoming a flea 
market vendor during the 
garage sale, please call 
Charles Ryan at 518-227-
8954.

Bethlehem Grange 137 
garage sale dates are Fri-
day and Saturday, July 14 
and 15, and again July 21 
and 22. All days are 9 a.m. 
to 3 p.m.  

Bethlehem Grange 137 

is located at 24 Bridge St., 
Selkirk, NY 12158.

RAFFLE 
ANNOUNCEMENT
The Bethlehem 

Grange #137 is raffling a 
residential Hannay hose 
reel, generously donated 
by “Hannay Reel” out of 
Westerlo. 

The company is the 
leading manufacturer of 
hose and cable reels for 
fire/rescue, LP gas, pe-
troleum and aviation fuel 
delivery. Although they 
produce the garden reels, 
typically, they focus on 
the larger reels. So, for the 
price of a raffle ticket, it 
could be uniquely yours. 

This hose reel is sold 

at retail for $510 and is 
stainless steel with pow-
der coating.

You can purchase a 
raffle ticket at any one 
of the Bethlehem grange 
events. Call Charles at 
518-227-8954 or Jackie 
at 518-810-6031 to pur-
chase tickets. The cost 
for a raffle ticket is $2 for 
one or $5 for three tickets. 
The drawing for this raffle 
will be Sept. 21 after the 
Grange’s barbecue.

Where else can you get 
a $510 garden hose reel 
for the price a a raffle tick-
et? It only takes one ticket 
to win!

OTHER GRANGE 
ACTIVITIES

Bethlehem Grange 137 
also accepts recyclable 
bottles and cans in the do-
nation box. Proceeds from 
the bottles and cans goes 
towards the maintenance 
of the historic Grange 
Hall, which is on the Na-
tional Registry of Historic 
Places.

Men’s, ladies’ and 
children’s clothing, shoes, 
boots, purses, belts, lin-
ens, stuffed animals, 
curtains, etc., are also 
accepted in the Grange’s 
Clothing Shed, which is 
open 24/7.  

The organization also 
collects non-perishable 
food for the food pan-
try, used eye glasses and 

hearing aids for the Lions 
Club.   

They also collect pull 
tabs from soda, beer, 
soup, seafood items and 
pet food, and hotel sam-
ple-sized toiletries or trial 
sizes, which are then do-
nated to the Ronald Mc-
Donald House.  

Bethlehem Grange 
137 also accepts worn and 
tattered American flags. 
Flags can be dropped off 
24/7 in the flag collection 
box in the front of the 
Grange Hall. The group is 
also a chapter of Stars for 
Our Troops.  

Bethlehem Grange is 
located at 24 Bridge St., 
Selkirk, NY 12158.

Upcoming events at Bethlehem Grange

The U.S. Environ-
mental Protection Agen-
cy (EPA) announced the 
formal establishment of 
the agency’s first-ever 
National Environmental 
Youth Advisory Council 
(NEYAC). 

The NEYAC will pro-
vide independent advice 
and recommendations to 
Administrator Michael S. 
Regan on how to increase 

EPA’s efforts to address 
a range of environmental 
issues as they relate to 
youth communities. 

The NEYAC will pro-
vide a critical perspective 
on how the impacts of cli-
mate change and other en-
vironmental harms affect 
youth communities. The 
Administrator announced 
his intent to launch the 
youth council last June at 

the Austrian World Sum-
mit.

EPA is soliciting appli-
cations for youth to fill 16 
vacancies on the NEYAC. 
Selected applicants will 
contribute to a balance 
of perspectives, back-
grounds and experience 
of the council and will be 
appointed by the adminis-
trator. 

As a first-of-its-kind 

committee, all members 
of NEYAC will be be-
tween the ages of 16 and 
29.

Applications to the 
NEYAC are due by Aug. 
22, at 11:59 p.m. ET. To 
apply for appointment to 
the council, the below in-
formation is required:

1. Contact informa-
tion.

2. Resume OR short 

biography OR qualifica-
tion essay.

3. Statement of inter-
est.

4. Media project.
Visit the EPA NEYAC 

webpage at epa.gov/ed-
ucation/national-envi-
ronmental-youth-adviso-
ry-council-neyac for more 
information on the coun-
cil and to apply.

The EPA will be host-

ing a virtual application 
webinar where the public 
can ask EPA staff ques-
tions live. The webi-
nar will be on Zoom on 
Monday, Aug. 7, from 
12-1 p.m. Register at 
the NEYAC webpage 
at epa.gov/education/
nat ional-environmen-
tal-youth-advisory-coun-
cil-neyac.

Youth invited to serve on National 
Environmental Youth Advisory Council
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DELMAR — The 
Asian longhorned bee-
tle is active from now 
through Labor Day. The 

New York State Depart-
ment of Environmental 
Conservation invites pool 
owners to regularly check 

filters for the invasive in-
sect and submit a report if 
any are found.

Asian longhorned bee-

tles attack and kill maples, 
birches, willows and oth-
er hardwoods trees. They 
emerge from infested 
trees in the late summer to 
find a new host. 

The beetles are 1.5 
inches long, have long 
black-and-white anten-
nae, and have black-and-
white spots on their body.

They should not be 
confused with the native 
white-spotted pine saw-

yer, which has a distinc-
tive white spot on their 
back, below their head.

No pool? You can still 
help! Be on the lookout 
for Asian longhorned bee-
tle exit holes, sawdust ac-
cumulating at the base of 
trees, oozing sap, or pits 
in bark, according to the 
DEC.

If you do find the bee-
tle or evidence of it:

• Email photos to the 

Forest Health Program; or
• Mail insects to DEC’s 

Forest Health Diagnostics 
Lab for identification:

NYSDEC Forest 
Health Diagnostic Labo-
ratory

Attn: Jessica Cancel-
liere

108 Game Farm Road
Delmar, NY 12054.
Learn more about ALB 

surveys on the DEC web-
site at dec.ny.gov.

Coeymans Hollow Volunteer Fire Corporation News
COEYMANS 
HOLLOW —                                                                          
• Recruitment and re-

tention:
Please consider joining 

your local volunteer fire 
company. They all need 
your help and are in des-
perate need of firefighters 
and EMTs. Summer is 
here and thye need to pre-
vent shortages of firefight-
ers throughout the sum-
mer and throughout the 
year. They will provide all 
the training necessary for 
you to become a volunteer 
firefighter or an EMT at no 
cost to you. If you are 16 
years old or older, and are 

interested in the volunteer 
fire service, please call the 
firehouse at 518-756-6310 
or stop by on drill night 
(Tuesdays) to see what it 
is all about or to obtain 
an application. For junior 
firefighters, remember 
— volunteering for your 
community looks good on 
your college or work ap-
plication. They have the 
equipment, now all they 
need is you. Please join 
today. Remember, they 
are neighbors helping 
neighbors. You can make 
a difference! 

• Events scheduled by 
neighboring fire compa-

nies and community or-
ganizations:

- Village of Ravena 
Mosher Park Pool Party 
50th Anniversary Cele-
bration on Saturday, July 
8, from noon to 5 p.m. 
Food, games, music and 
swimming. Donations at 
the door to sponsor chil-
dren’s activities for the 
Friendship Festival.

- Capital Bicycle Rac-
ing Club 22nd Annual 
Road Race will be held 
on July 15, beginning at 9 
a.m. at the high school.

- The 140th anniversa-
ry celebration of Callanan 
Industries will be on July 
15, from 11 a.m. to 3 p.m. 

on County Route 101. 
There will be food trucks, 
music, kids’ activities, 
quarry tours and heavy 
equipment. Learn about 
what they do and more.

- Cornell Hook & 
Ladder Golf Tournament 
will be on Sunday, Au-
gust 20, at the Sycamore 
Golf Course beginning at 
10 a.m. Lunch and din-
ner will be provided for 
all participants as well as 
many prizes. Contact John 
Wallace or Jeff Deso to 
register.

- Selkirk Fire Compa-
ny No. 2 Glenmont Flea 
Market will be on Satur-

day, July 29, from 8 a.m. 
to 5 p.m. Over 100 ven-
dors and refreshments will 
be available for purchase.

• Drill scheduled:
Tim Pinson, Coey-

mans Hollow training of-
ficer, has announced that 
the drill scheduled for 
Tuesday, July 18. will be 
on roof ventilation. The 
drill will begin promptly 
at 7 p.m. and all Coey-
mans Hollow firefighters 
and EMS personnel are 
encouraged to attend.

• Capital Bicycle 
Racing Club Road Race 
scheduled for July 15:

The Capital Bicycle 

Racing Club will host its 
22nd annual road race 
through Ravena, Coey-
mans Hollow and Selkirk. 
Motor vehicles will have 
limited access to the race 
route and short closures 
will occur to allow rac-
ers to pass through inter-
sections safely. The race 
course will be clearly 
marked and motorists are 
asked to be cautious.  

• Safety tip:
If the pavement is too 

hot for you to walk on 
in your bare feet, then it 
is too hot for your pet to 
walk on. Keep your pet 
safe.
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REQUEST A 
FREE QUOTE
CALL NOW BEFORE THE 
NEXT POWER OUTAGE

(877) 516-1160

Prepare 
for power 
outages 
today 
WITH A HOME 
STANDBY GENERATOR

$0 MONEY DOWN + LOW MONTHLY PAYMENT OPTIONS
Contact a Generac dealer for full terms and conditions 

*To qualify, consumers must request a quote, purchase, install and activate the 
generator with a participating dealer. Call for a full list of terms and conditions.

FREE 7-Year Extended Warranty* 
– A $695 Value!

One touch of a button 
sends help fast, 24/7.

alone
I’m never

Life Alert®  is always 
here for me.

I’ve fallen and I can’t get up!

®

Help at Home

with  GPS!

Help On-the-Go

For a FREE brochure call: 

1-800-404-9776

Saving a Life EVERY 11 MINUTES

Batteries Never Need Charging.

FINANCING AVAILABLE WITH APPROVED CREDIT

Call today and receive a 

FREE SHOWER 
PACKAGE

PLUS $1600 OFF

With purchase of a new Safe Step Walk-In Tub. Not applicable with any previous 
walk-in tub purchase. Offer available while supplies last. No cash value. Must present 

offer at time of purchase. CSLB 1082165  NSCB 0082999  0083445

1-855-916-54731-855-916-5473

Courtesy of Department of Environmental Conservation    
The Asian longhorned beetle.

Check your pool filter for Asian longhorned beetle

Honey, Maple Syrup, Eggs, Jams, Local made 
gifts, Yarns, Fiber, Crystals, Angel Cards and a 
line of Native American Items and Antiques to 
choose from. Stop by and see our items & Us! 

Christmas is just around the corner and we have 
just what you need for the holidays!!!

Cluckin’ “A” Farm
680 West Road

Greenville, NY 12083
518-966-5157

Friday & Saturday 12 noon until 5:00
other times by appointment only

Honey, Maple Syrup, Eggs, Jams, Local made gifts, 
Yarns, Fiber, Crystals, Angel Cards and a line of 
Native American Items and Antiques to choose 

from. Stop by and see our items & Us!

Cluckin’ “A” Farm
680 West Road

Greenville, NY 12083
518-966-5157

Friday & Saturday 12 noon until 5:00
other times by appointment only

LOCAL ARTISTS!
Unique Items FromUnique Items From

In Print & Online | TheUpStater.com
ravenanewsroom@gmail.com

Go to: 
theupstater.com/newsletters
or scan the QR Code to select 
the newsletter of your choice.

Weekly Newsletters

P.O. BOX 13
RAVENA, NY 12143

Sign Up for Our

HOT TOPICS 
OBITUARIES 

SPORTS
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filed with Secretary of State 
of NY (SSNY) on 2023-03-
23. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of upon whom 
process against it may 
be served. SSNY should 
mail process to Northwest 
Registered Agent LLC: 418 
Broadway Suite N Albany 
NY 12207. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Form. of NO-
BLEBOW LLC. Arts. of 
Org. filed with SSNY on 
05/18/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of LLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail pro-
cess to 90 STATE STREET, 
SUITE 700 BOX 10, ALBA-
NY, NY 12207. Any lawful 
purpose.

Notice of Form. of MAR-
SPROJECT LLC. Arts. of 
Org. filed with SSNY on 
05/19/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of LLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail pro-
cess to 90 STATE STREET, 
SUITE 700 BOX 10, ALBA-
NY, NY 12207. Any lawful 
purpose.

Notice of Form. of SAB-
BATH LEGACY CAPITAL, 
LLC. Arts. of Org. filed with 
SSNY on 05/11/2023. Of-
fice location: Albany SSNY 
desg. as agent of LLC upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
mail process to 90 STATE 
STREET, SUITE 700 BOX 
10, ALBANY, NY, 12207. 
Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of Sixth 
Peak Armory. Articles of Or-
ganization filed with Secre-
tary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-05-30. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Northwest Registered 
Agent LLC: 418 Broadway 
STE N Albany NY 12207. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Formation of Hold 
Yer Horse Stable LLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-06-
26. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
Hold Yer Horse Stable LLC: 
102 Kruger Rd Selkirk NY 
12158. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

NOTICE OF FORMATION 
OF A LIMITED LIABILI-
TY COMPANYNotice of 
Form. of TRIARCH MAN-
AGEMENT II LLC. Arts. of 
Org. filed with SSNY on 
05/18/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of LLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail pro-
cess to 90 STATE STREET, 
SUITE 700 BOX 10, ALBA-
NY, NY 12207. Any lawful 
purpose.

Notice of Formation of The 
Paloma Girls, LLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-03-
18. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
Northwest Registered 
Agent: 418 Broadway STE 
N Albany NY 12207. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
EBCC LLC. Arts of Org 
filed with the SSNY on 
07/03/2023. Office: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agt upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY shall mail process to 
the LLC, 19 Clinton St, Apt 
204, New York, NY 10002 
Purpose: any lawful activity

Notice of Formation of LIT-
TLE LAMBS LLC. Arts of 
Org filed with the SSNY on 
06/01/2023. Office: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agt upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY shall mail process 
to the LLC, 7001 Brush 
Hollow Rd, Westbury, NY 
11590 Purpose: any lawful 
activity

Notice of Formation of Em-
bark Properties, LLC. Ar-
ticles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-05-
03. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
Registered Agents Inc.: 418 
Broadway, STE R Albany 
NY 12207. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Form. of GK 
SUB SHOP 1, LLC. Arts. 
of Org. filed with SSNY on 
1/11/2022. Office location: 
Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of LLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail process 
to 612 WATERVLIET SHAK-
ER ROAD, LATHAM, NY, 
12110. Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of A1 
CARE & SERVICES COOR-
DINATION LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-06-05. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to A1 CARE & SERVICES 
COORDINATION LLC: 132 
32ND STREET BROOKLYN 
NY 11232. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
BGCSY Consulting. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-01-
11. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
BGCSY Consulting: 1326 
59th Street Brooklyn NY 
11219. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Formation of JCS 
Apparel, LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-02-01. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Northwest Registered 
Agent LLC: 418 Broadway 
STE N Albany NY 12207. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Formation of 
Waverly Unit 31 LLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-05-
24. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
Waverly Unit 31 LLC: 1238 
47th Street Brooklyn NY 
11219. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Formation of 
Strawberries and Cream 
LLC. Articles of Organiza-
tion filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-06-01. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Northwest Registered 
Agents : 418 Broadway Ste 
N Albany NY 12207. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose

Notice of Form. of GOOD 
RACK LLC. Arts. of 
Org. filed with SSNY on 
05/26/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of LLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail process 
to 1967 WEHRLE DRIVE, 
SUITE 1-086, BUFFALO, 
NY, 14221. Any lawful pur-
pose.

Notice of Formation of Full 
Access LLC. Articles of Or-
ganization filed with Secre-
tary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-06-13. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Northwest Registered 
Agent LLC: 418 Broadway 
STE N Albany NY 12207. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Formation of 
GoodVets Services of 
Brooklyn Heights LLC. Ar-
ticles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-03-
20. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
REGISTERED AGENTS 
INC.: 418 Broadway, STE R 
Albany NY 12207. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
Preston Property Services 
LLC. Articles of Organiza-
tion filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-06-11. Office lo-
cation: Albany County. 
SSNY designated as agent 
of upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail pro-

cess to Preston Property 
Services LLC: 1443 Indian 
Fields Road Feura Bush NY 
12067. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Formation of 
AUGUST JAC LLC. Arts of 
Org filed with the SSNY on 
06/19/2023. Office: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agt upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY shall mail process 
to the LLC, 7001 Brush 
Hollow Rd, Westbury, NY 
11590 Purpose: any lawful 
activity

A1 ARMOR CLEANING 
SERVICE LLC. Art of Org. 
filed with the SSNY on 
05/25/2023. Office: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of the LLC upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
shall mail copy of process 
to the LLC, LEGALCORP 
SOLUTIONS 1060 Broad-
way Suite 100 ALBANY, NY 
12204 Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose.

Notice of Form. of 515 
PARK AVENUE 18 LLC. 
Arts. of Org. filed with 
SSNY on 05/12/2023. Of-
fice location: Albany SSNY 
desg. as agent of LLC upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
mail process to 90 STATE 
STREET, SUITE 700 BOX 
10, ALBANY, NY, 12207. 
Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Form. of KNC813 
WELLINGTON MAN-
AGEMENT, LLC. Arts. of 
Org. filed with SSNY on 
05/01/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of LLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail process 
to 31 WELLINGTON AVE-
NUE, ALBANY, NY 12203. 
Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of 
Decker Disposal, LLC. Ar-
ticles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-05-
26. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY should mail 
process to The LLC: c/o 
Whiteman Osterman & 
Hanna LLP One Commerce 
Plaza Albany NY 12260. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Form. of 241 LE-
NOX AVE OWNER LLC. 
Arts. of Org. filed with 
SSNY on 05/03/2023. Of-
fice location: Albany SSNY 
desg. as agent of LLC upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
mail process to 90 STATE 
STREET, SUITE 700 BOX 
10, ALBANY, NY, 12207. 
Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of 
SHODAH PROPERTIES 
LLC. Articles of Organiza-
tion filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2022-12-14. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to SHODAH PROPERTIES: 
2 HOEY CIRCLE POMONA 
NY 10970. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Form. of SPORTS 
CONSULTING AND IN-
VESTING LLC. Arts. of 
Org. filed with SSNY on 
05/17/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of LLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail process 
to 1967 WEHRLE DRIVE, 
SUITE 1-086, BUFFALO, 
NY, 14221. Any lawful pur-
pose.

Notice of Formation of 
Peace and Kaos Media 
Productions. Articles of Or-
ganization filed with Secre-
tary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-06-08. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Northwest Registered 
Agent LLC: 418 Broadway, 
STE N Albany NY 12207. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Qualification of 
ALLEGIANT PARTNERS, 
LLC. Certificate of Authority 
filed with Secretary of State 
of NY (SSNY) on 2023-03-
16 Office location: Albany 
County. Limited Liability 
Company (LLC) formed in 
DE on 2023-03-07. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY shall mail process 
to Northwest Registered 
Agent LLC: 418 Broadway 
STE N Albany NY 12207 
Articles of Organization 
originally filed with DE 
Secretary of State (SOS). 8 
The Green STE B Dover DE 
19901. Purpose: Any lawful 

purpose.

Notice of Form. of JME 
& CO. NYC, LLC. Arts. of 
Org. filed with SSNY on 
05/15/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of LLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail pro-
cess to 90 STATE STREET, 
SUITE 700 BOX 10, ALBA-
NY, NY, 12207. Any lawful 
purpose.

Notice of Formation of AHG 
Assets LLC. Articles of Or-
ganization filed with Secre-
tary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-05-22. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Registered Agents INC: 
418 Broadway STE R Alba-
ny NY 12207. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of Vir-
tuous Pursuits LLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on June 13, 
2023. Office location: Al-
bany County. SSNY des-
ignated as agent of Lim-
ited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Northwest Registered 
Agent LLC: 418 Broadway 
Suite N Albany NY 12207. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Formation of Zili-
zaza, LLC. Articles of Orga-
nization filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-06-27. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to New York Registered 
Agent: 418 Broadway Ste. 
Y Albany NY 12207. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of AL-
DEN BUSH, DNP - NURSE 
PRACTITIONER IN PSY-
CHIATRY PLLC. Articles 
of Organization filed with 
Secretary of State of NY 
(SSNY) on 2023-05-30. 
Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY should mail 
process to THOMAS LAW 
FIRM PLLC: 131 7TH AV-
ENUE #204 New York NY 
10011. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Formation of 
Devils Choice LLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-05-
23. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to Jer-
emy Degracia: 70 Morris St 
Albany NY 12208. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
Phase Lighting Audio 
Events LLC. Articles of Or-
ganization filed with Secre-
tary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-06-07. Office loca-
tion: Greene County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Christopher Wilson: P.O. 
Box 192 Round Top NY 
12473. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Form. of YAD 
AVRAHAM DOVID MAR-
RIAGE WORKSHOP LLC. 
Arts. of Org. filed with 
SSNY on 05/23/2023. Of-
fice location: Albany SSNY 
desg. as agent of LLC upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
mail process to 90 STATE 
STREET, SUITE 700 BOX 
10, ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of 1712 
Davidson Holdings LLC. 
Articles of Organization 
filed with Secretary of State 
of NY (SSNY) on 2023-02-
15. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY should mail 
process to 1712 Davidson 
Holdings LLC: 199 Lee Av-
enue Suite 411 Brooklyn 
NY 11211. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
40 BAILEY LLC. Arts. Of 
Org. filed with SSNY on 
06/06/2023. Office loca-
tion Greene SSNY desg. 
As agent of LLC upon 
whom process against it 
may be served SSNY mail 
process to 65 KATYDID 
DR, BRANCHBURG, NJ, 
08876. Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of 
Lurie Technologies, LLC. 
Articles of Organization 

Notice of Formation of 
170-172 Holland LLC. Ar-
ticles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-03-
16. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 170-
172 Holland LLC: 75 Hun-
tington Street Brooklyn NY 
11231. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

NOTICE OF ORGANIZA-
TION OF LIMITED LIA-
BILITY COMPANY FIRST: 
The name of the Limited 
Liability Company is R&M 
Catskill, LLC (hereinafter 
referred to as the “Com-
pany”). SECOND: The Arti-
cles of Organization of the 
Company were filed with 
the Secretary of State on 
June 19, 2023. THIRD: The 
County within the State 
of New York in which the 
office of the Company is 
located is Greene County. 
FOURTH: The Secretary of 
State has been designated 
as agent upon whom pro-
cess against the Company 
may be served. The post 
office address to which 
the Secretary of State shall 
mail process is 2758 Old 
Kings Road, Catskill, New 
York 12414. FIFTH: The 
Company is organized for 
all lawful purposes. DATED: 
June 19, 2023 GUTERMAN 
SHALLO & ALFORD, PLLC 
21 North Seventh Street 
Hudson, New York 12534 
(518) 828-5400

PUBLIC AUCTION 
OF  STATE SURPLUS VE-
HICLES AND EQUIPMENT 
AT:  NYS OFFICE OF GEN-
ERAL SERVICES  1220 
WASHINGTON AVE – SUR-
PLUS LOT B,  ALBANY, 
NY 12226    ON WEDNES-
DAY JULY 19, 2023, 
AT 9:30AM  PREVIEW: 
8:30AM (CATALOGS AVAIL-
ABLE AT TIME OF PRE-
VIEW)    AUCTION ITEMS 
TO INCLUDE:    SURPLUS 
VEHICLES, TOOLS, AND 
OTHER MISCELLANEOUS 
ITEMS.    TO VIEW UP TO 
DATE AUCTION ITEMS 
AND PHOTOS  VISIT OUR 
WEBSITE AT:  NYSStore.
com (518) 457-6335

TERESA’S ARTISTRY LLC. 
Art of Org. filed with the 
SSNY on 03/30/2023. Of-
fice: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of the 
LLC upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY shall mail copy of 
process to the LLC, LE-
GALCORP SOLUTIONS 
1060 Broadway Suite 100 
ALBANY, NY 12204 Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of 45 
WINDSOR LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-05-22. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to 45 WINDSOR LLC : 555 
FLUSHING AVE BROOK-
LYN NY 11206. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of Bu-
chanan Equities LLC. Ar-
ticles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-03-
29. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to Bu-
chanan Equities LLC: 2420 
Campbell Ave Schenecta-
dy NY 12306. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of Mu-
genn Universal, LLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-06-
13. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liability 
Company (LLC) upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY should mail 
process to Northwest Reg-
istered Agent: 418 BROAD-
WAY STE N ALBANY NY 
12207. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Formation of CNY 
Tech Services LLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-05-
01. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
Registered Agents Inc.: 418 
Broadway STE R Albany 
NY 12207. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
TALK LINK LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-05-03. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 

Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail pro-
cess to CHAYA PERL: 593 
E 3RD ST Brooklyn NY 
11218. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Form. of CJB 
WEALTH MANAGEMENT, 
LLC. Arts. of Org. filed with 
SSNY on 05/24/2023. Of-
fice location: Albany SSNY 
desg. as agent of LLC upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
mail process to 1280 NEW 
SCOTLAND ROAD, SLING-
ERLANDS, NY, 12159. Any 
lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of 
PISIECZKO PENSION 
HOLDINGS LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-04-27. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail pro-
cess to PISIECZKO PEN-
SION HOLDINGS LLC: 418 
BROADWAY STE Y ALBA-
NY NY 12207. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of Le-
mus Nova LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-05-23. Office loca-
tion: Greene County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to LLC: 16 Bailey Rd Purl-
ing NY 12470. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of Ve-
lare Bags LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-05-22. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to New York Registered 
Agent LLC: 418 Broadway 
STE Y Albany NY 12207. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Formation of 
Ashuraey Law PLLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-05-
11. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Professional 
Limited Liability Company 
(PLLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Northwest Registered 
Agent LLC: 418 Broadway 
STE N Albany NY 12207. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Qual. of CHAR-
LEMONT MANAGEMENT 
LLC Auth. filed with SSNY 
on 05/11/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany. LLC formed in 
DE on 01/17/2023. SSNY 
desg. as agent of LLC upon 
whom process against it 
may be served. SSNY mail 
process to: 1967 WEHR-
LE DRIVE, SUITE 1-086, 
BUFFALO, NY, 14221. Arts. 
of Org. filed with DE SOS. 
Townsend Bldg. Dover, DE 
19901. Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of 652 
Myrtle LLC. Articles of Or-
ganization filed with Secre-
tary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-05-11. Office 
location: Albany County. 
SSNY designated as agent 
of Limited Liability Com-
pany (LLC) upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY should mail 
process to Gregory Bruno: 
652 Myrtle Ave Albany NY 
12208. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Formation of El-
mhurst Investors, LLC . Ar-
ticles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-06-
15. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
Registered Agents, Inc. : 
418 Broadway, Ste R Alba-
ny NY 12207. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Form. of BANG-
KOK IN BROOKLYN LLC. 
Arts. of Org. filed with 
SSNY on 05/25/2023. Of-
fice location: Albany SSNY 
desg. as agent of LLC upon 
whom process against it 
may be served. SSNY mail 
process to 472 LORIM-
ER ST, BROOKLYN, NY, 
11211. Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of 
Heather Mueller, Nurse 
Practitioner in Psychiatry, 
PLLC. Articles of Organi-
zation filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-06-22. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Professional Limited Li-

ability Company (PLLC) 
upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Northwest Registered 
Agent LLC: 418 Broadway 
Ste N Albany NY 12207. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Form. of AVILES 
LAW FIRM PLLC. Arts. of 
Org. filed with SSNY on 
05/10/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of PLLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail process 
to 90 STATE STREET, , 
SUITE 700 BOX 10, ALBA-
NY, NY, 12207. Any lawful 
purpose.

Notice of Formation of 
Emery Infrastructure LLC. 
Articles of Organization 
filed with Secretary of 
State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-02-16. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Registered Northwest 
Agent: 418 Broadway STE 
N Albany NY 12207. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose

Notice of Form. of 25909 81 
AVE LLC. Arts. of Org. filed 
with SSNY on 05/12/2023. 
Office location: Albany 
SSNY desg. as agent of 
LLC upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY mail process to 90 
STATE STREET, SUITE 
700 BOX 10, ALBANY, NY, 
12207. Any lawful purpose

Notice of Form. of LA FA-
MILIA DE CINCO LLC. Arts. 
of Org. filed with SSNY on 
12/19/2022. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of LLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail process 
to 90 STATE STREET STE 
700 BOX 10 , ALBANY, NY, 
12207. Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of Bri-
an Wickham Manufacturing 
Solutions LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-04-05. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Brian Wickham: 272 Ma-
ple Ave Selkirk NY 12186. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Formation of 4200 
Victory LLC. Articles of Or-
ganization filed with Secre-
tary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-02-07. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to 4200 Victory LLC: 75 
Huntington Street Brooklyn 
NY 11231. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
Yesilkart Forum LLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-03-
29. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liability 
Company (LLC) upon whom 
process against it may 
be served. SSNY should 
mail process to Northwest 
Registered Agent LLC: 418 
BROADWAY STE N Albany 
NY 12207. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

LOVE TRACTOR LLC. Art of 
Org. filed with the SSNY on 
03/17/2023. Office: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of the LLC upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
shall mail copy of process 
to the LLC, LEGALCORP 
SOLUTIONS 1060 Broad-
way Suite 100 ALBANY, NY 
12204 Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose.

Notice of Form. of DIEGET-
IC MEDIA, LLC. Arts. of 
Org. filed with SSNY on 
03/16/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of LLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail pro-
cess to 90 STATE STREET, 
SUITE 700 BOX 10, ALBA-
NY, NY, 12207. Any lawful 
purpose.

Notice of Formation of 
TWIN GROUP NY LLC. Ar-
ticles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-03-
22. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY should mail 
process to TWIN GROUP 
NY LLC : 199 LEE AVE 
SUITE 554 BROOKLYN NY 
11211. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Formation of 
Anna Jankowska Psychol-
ogist PLLC. Articles of Or-
ganization filed with Secre-

tary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2022-05-27. Office 
location: Albany County. 
SSNY designated as agent 
of Professional Limited 
Liability Company (PLLC) 
upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to REGISTERED AGENTS 
INC.: 418 Broadway STE R 
Albany NY 12207. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 170-
172 Holland Ave LLC. Ar-
ticles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-02-
23. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 170-
172 Holland Ave LLC: 4770 
White Plains Rd Bronx NY 
10470. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Formation of So-
rensen Registered Nurse 
Services, PLLC. Articles 
of Organization filed with 
Secretary of State of NY 
(SSNY) on 2022-09-21. 
Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Professional 
Limited Liability Company 
(PLLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to REGISTERED AGENTS 
INC.: 418 Broadway STE R 
Albany NY 12207. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
Dough! A Gluten and Dairy 
Free Bakery LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-06-07. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Northwestern Registered 
Agent LLC : 418 Broadway 
STE N Albany NY 12207. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

FRESHPAGE MAJES-
TY ENT LLC Art of Org. 
filed with the SSNY on 
04/03/2023. Office: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of the LLC upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
shall mail copy of process 
to the LLC, LEGALCORP 
SOLUTIONS 1060 Broad-
way Suite 100 ALBANY, NY 
12204 Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose.

Notice of Formation of Ken-
neth Katz Law PLLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-06-
12. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Professional 
Limited Liability Company 
(PLLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Northwest Registered 
Agent LLC: 418 Broadway 
STE N Albany NY 12207. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Formation of WA-
VERLY 30 LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-05-24. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to WAVERLY 30 LLC: 1238 
47th Street Brooklyn NY 
11219. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Formation of 
KINGS 11 ELECTRONICS 
LLC. Articles of Organiza-
tion filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-02-03. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Registered Agents INC: 
418 Broadway STE R Alba-
ny NY 12207. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Form. of PER-
MISSIBLE CAPITAL LLC. 
Arts. of Org. filed with 
SSNY on 05/18/2023. Of-
fice location: Albany SSNY 
desg. as agent of LLC upon 
whom process against it 
may be served. SSNY mail 
process to 1967 WEHRLE 
DRIVE, SUITE 1-086, BUF-
FALO, NY, 14221. Any law-
ful purpose.

SERRES LLC Art of Org. 
filed with the SSNY on 
06/07/2023. Office: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of the LLC upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
shall mail copy of process 
to the LLC, LEGALCORP 
SOLUTIONS 1060 Broad-
way Suite 100 ALBANY, NY 
12204 Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose.
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REPAIR LLC. Art of Org. 
filed with the SSNY on 
05/02/2023. Office: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of the LLC upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
shall mail copy of process 
to the LLC, LEGALCORP 
SOLUTIONS 1060 Broad-
way Suite 100 ALBANY, NY 
12204 Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose.

Notice of Form. of BRUCE 
H. YAFFE MEDICAL SER-
VICES PLLC. Arts. of 
Org. filed with SSNY on 
05/16/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of PLLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail process 
to 90 STATE STREET, , 
SUITE 700 BOX 10, ALBA-
NY, NY, 12207. Any lawful 
purpose.

Notice of Form. of META-
BOLIC NASHVILLE, LLC. 
Arts. of Org. filed with 
SSNY on 04/05/2023. Of-
fice location: Albany SSNY 
desg. as agent of LLC upon 
whom process against it 
may be served. SSNY mail 
process to 180 LOUDON 
RD., LATHAM, NY, 12110. 
Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of 
Round Top Small Engine 
Repair. Articles of Organi-
zation filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-05-24. Office lo-
cation: Greene County. 
SSNY designated as agent 
of upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Connie Grasse: 35 Win-
ter Clove Road Ext Round 
Top NY 12473. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose

Notice of Form. of FOX-
RIDGE PARTNERS, LLC. 
Arts. of Org. filed with 
SSNY on 05/16/2023. Of-
fice location: Albany SSNY 
desg. as agent of LLC upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
mail process to 90 STATE 
STREET, SUITE 700 BOX 
10, ALBANY, NY, 12207. 
Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of AA 
Basement Technologies 
LLC. Articles of Organiza-
tion filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-05-05. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to LLC: 975 Starr Road 
Ravena NY 12143. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
MENDEL PANETH LLC. Ar-
ticles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2022-11-
28. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
MENDEL PANETH LLC: 85 
BOLIVAR STREET STATEN 
ISLAND, NY 10314. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 117 
HART ST LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-05-19. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to 117 HART ST LLC: 52 
B BROADWAY ST LLC 

Brooklyn NY 11249. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of Wild 
Amaranth Farm LLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-02-
09. Office location: Greene 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
Craig J Marcklinger : 247 
Jefferson Heights Apart-
ment 3 Catskill NY 12414. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Formation of VEM 
MARKETING LLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-04-
21. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
VEM MARKETING LLC: 
418 BROADWAY STE R 
ALBANY NY 12207. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of Big 
Barn Realty, LLC. Articles 
of Organization filed with 
Secretary of State of NY 
(SSNY) on 2023-05-31. 
Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
Big Barn Realty, LLC: 707 
County Route 401 Wester-
lo NY 12193. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of Kin-
esthetic Minds LLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-05-
26. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to New 
York Registered Agent LLC: 
418 Broadway, R Albany 
NY 12207. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of In-
terstate Cleaning Services 
LLC. Articles of Organiza-
tion filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-05-16. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Robin Jones: 418 Broad-
way Albany NY 12207-
2950. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Form. of TRUE 
BARBERS LLC. Arts. of 
Org. filed with SSNY on 
05/15/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of LLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail pro-
cess to 90 STATE STREET, 
SUITE 700 BOX 10, ALBA-
NY, NY, 12207. Any lawful 
purpose.

Notice of Formation of 
UNITED LICENSED BE-
HAVIOR ANALYST ABA 
PLLC. Articles of Organi-
zation filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-02-22. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 

to THE PLLC: 1441 46TH 
STREET BROOKLYN NY 
11219. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Formation of 
LTG EQUITIES LLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-05-
18. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY should mail 
process to LTG EQUITIES 
LLC: 1324 43RD STREET 
BROOKLYN NY 11219. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Qualification of 
Think About Me, LLC. Cer-
tificate of Authority filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-06-
21 Office location: Albany 
County. Limited Liability 
Company (LLC) formed in 
NY on 2023-06-21. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY shall mail process to 
Northwestwest Registered 
Agent LLC: 522 W River-
side Ave. Suite N Spokane 
WA 99201 Articles of Or-
ganization originally filed 
with NY Secretary of State 
(SOS). 4746 Carpenter Av-
enue Bronx NY 10470. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of NAL 
770 LLC. Articles of Orga-
nization filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-02-28. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Registered Agents INC: 
418 Broadway STE R AL-
BANY NY 12207. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
Boards and Bites LLC. Ar-
ticles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-05-
16. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
Boards and Bites LLC: 305 
Lexington Street Ballston 
Spa NY 12020. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
Cerebratech Research and 
Consulting LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-06-02. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Cerebratech Research 
and Consulting LLC: 418 
Broadway STE R Albany 
NY 112207. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
2182 ATLANTIC GROUP 
LLC. Articles of Organiza-
tion filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-05-08. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to 2182 ATLANTIC GROUP 
LLC: 166 CLYMER ST 
Brooklyn NY 11211. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
smoov shopping and re-

tail. Articles of Organization 
filed with Secretary of State 
of NY (SSNY) on 2023-05-
03. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to Nat 
Smith: 418 Broadway STE 
N Albany NY 12207. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
VISAFLEX LAW PLLC. Ar-
ticles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-05-
16. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Professional 
Limited Liability Company 
(PLLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to REGISTERED AGENTS 
INC.: 418 Broadway STE R 
Albany NY 12207. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of Art-
ful Studios. Articles of Or-
ganization filed with Secre-
tary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-06-19. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Northwest Registered 
Agent: 418 Broadway STE 
N Albany NY 12207. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
Rebecca Eisner, LLC. Ar-
ticles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-03-
01. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liability 
Company (LLC) upon whom 
process against it may 
be served. SSNY should 
mail process to Northwest 
Registered Agent LLC: 418 
Broadway Ste N Albany NY 
12207. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Form. of ZENITH 
MARKETING AGENCY 
LLC. Arts. of Org. filed with 
SSNY on 05/15/2023. Of-
fice location: Albany SSNY 
desg. as agent of LLC upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
mail process to 90 STATE 
STREET, SUITE 700 BOX 
10, ALBANY, NY, 12207. 
Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of 
Dhamo LLC. Articles of Or-
ganization filed with Secre-
tary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-06-01. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to New York Registered 
Agent LLC: 418 Broadway 
Ste Y Albany NY 12207. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Formation of 
1000 Dean Brooklyn LLC. 
Articles of Organization 
filed with Secretary of 
State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-01-18. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to 1000 Dean Brooklyn 
LLC: 75 Huntington Street 
Brooklyn NY 11231. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
Kreider Spataro LLC. Ar-
ticles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 

NY (SSNY) on 2023-04-
18. Office location: Greene 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
REPUBLIC REGISTERED 
AGENT SERVICES INC.: 54 
State Street Ste 804 Albany 
NY 12207. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of HOT 
POINT TOUR LLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-05-
31. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
Northwest Registered 
Agent LLC: 418 Broadway 
STE N ALBANY NY 12207. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Formation of PHP 
LAW PLLC. Articles of Or-
ganization filed with Secre-
tary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-05-19. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Professional Limited Liabil-
ity Company (PLLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to New 
York Registered Agent LLC: 
418 Broadway STE Y Alba-
ny NY 12207. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Form. of 25911 81 
AVE LLC. Arts. of Org. filed 
with SSNY on 05/12/2023. 
Office location: Albany 
SSNY desg. as agent of 
LLC upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY mail process to 90 
STATE STREET, SUITE 
700 BOX 10, ALBANY, NY, 
12207. Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of DKA 
& One LLC. Articles of Or-
ganization filed with Secre-
tary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-06-08. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to REPUBLIC REGIS-
TERED AGENT SERVICES 
INC.: 54 STATE STREET 
STE 804 Albany NY 12207. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Formation of 
Faibish Capital LLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-02-
06. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to 
Faibish Capital LLC: 4118 
14th Avenue Suite #4 
Brooklyn NY 11219. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of LI 
EXOTICS, LLC. Arts of 
Org filed with the SSNY on 
06/03/2023. Office: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agt upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY shall mail process 
to the LLC, 7001 Brush 
Hollow Rd, Westbury, NY 
11590 Purpose: any lawful 
activity

Notice of Formation of 
Quamar LLC. Articles of Or-
ganization filed with Secre-
tary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-06-05. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 

designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to SSNY: 13 Ross Court 
Loudonville NY 12211. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose

Notice of Form. of JEREMY 
MONTROSE DENTISTRY, 
PLLC. Arts. of Org. filed 
with SSNY on 05/16/2023. 
Office location: Albany 
SSNY desg. as agent of 
PLLC upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY mail process to 90 
STATE STREET, , SUITE 
700 BOX 10, ALBANY, NY, 
12207. Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of AV-
DOO & PARTNERS MAR-
KETING LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-02-22. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Registered Agents INC: 
418 Broadway STE R AL-
BANY NY 12207. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of By-
ronJBeggs LLC. Articles 
of Organization filed with 
Secretary of State of NY 
(SSNY) on 2023-05-24. 
Office location: Greene 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY should mail 
process to Aaron O’Brien: 
PO Box 14 New Baltimore 
NY 12124. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Form. of STUN-
NING JEWELRY LLC. Arts. 
of Org. filed with SSNY on 
05/10/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of LLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail pro-
cess to 90 STATE STREET, 
SUITE 700 BOX 10, ALBA-
NY, NY, 12207. Any lawful 
purpose.

Notice of Formation of 
Bridgeform LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-03-09. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Bridgeform LLC: 202 
Foster Ave Brooklyn NY 
11230. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Formation of 
42ND FLOOR CONSULT-
ING LLC. Articles of Orga-
nization filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-06-06. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to 42ND FLOOR CON-
SULTING LLC: 19 Dutch 
Street 42H New York NY 
10038. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Form. of SO-
LARBLOCKS ENERGY 
LLC. Arts. of Org. filed with 
SSNY on 05/11/2023. Of-
fice location: Albany SSNY 
desg. as agent of LLC upon 
whom process against it 
may be served. SSNY mail 
process to 3 GRACE AVE, 
GREAT NECK, NY, 11021. 
Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of JR 
Wood LLC. Articles of Or-

ganization filed with Secre-
tary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-05-31. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to JR Wood LLC: 103 Web-
ster Ave FL 2 Brooklyn NY 
11230. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Formation of 
Chauncey Property Man-
agement LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-05-22. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to REGISTERED AGENTS 
INC.: 418 BROADWAY, STE 
R ALBANY NY 12207. Pur-
pose: Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
Over Drinks Productions 
LLC. Articles of Organiza-
tion filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-05-01. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Registered Agents Inc.: 
418 Broadway Ste R Alba-
ny NY 12207. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of Koru 
Studio LLC. Articles of Or-
ganization filed with Secre-
tary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-02-06. Office 
location: Albany County. 
SSNY designated as agent 
of  upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Northwest Registered 
Agent: 418 Broadway   Al-
bany NY 12207. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of YNK 
Solutions LLC. Articles of 
Organization filed with Sec-
retary of State of NY (SSNY) 
on 2023-02-21. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to YNK Solutions LLC: 202 
Foster Ave Brooklyn NY 
11230. Purpose: Any lawful 
purpose

Notice of Form. of BEAU-
TY LASER SPA LLC. Arts. 
of Org. filed with SSNY on 
05/25/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of LLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail process 
to 32-62 FRANCIS LEW-
IS BLVD, FLUSHING, NY, 
11358. Any lawful purpose. 
Notice of Qualification of 
Mezeh 111 Fulton LLC. 
Certificate of Authority filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2022-11-
28 Office location: Albany 
County. Limited Liability 
Company (LLC) formed in 
VA on 2022-11-28. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY shall mail process to 
Incorp Services, INC: One 
Commerce Plaza 99 wash-
ington Ave., Suite 805A 
Albany NY 12210-2822 
Articles of Organization 
originally filed with VA Sec-
retary of State (SOS). 3975 
Fair Ridge Drive Suite N430 
Fairfax VA 22033. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose.

Notice of Formation of BSD 
Y&U REALTY LLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-03-
06. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to BSD 
Y&U REALTY LLC: 1421 
52ND STREET BROOKLYN 
NY 11219. Purpose: Any 
lawful purpose

Notice of Form. of CUS-
TOM RESIDENTIAL 
SOLUTIONS, LLC. Arts. 
of Org. filed with SSNY on 
05/23/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of LLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail pro-
cess to 90 STATE STREET, 
SUITE 700 BOX 10, ALBA-
NY, NY 12207. Any lawful 
purpose.

Notice of Formation of Sta-
ble View Pastures LLC. Ar-
ticles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-05-
31. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Limited Liabil-
ity Company (LLC) upon 
whom process against 
it may be served. SSNY 
should mail process to Nat 
smith: 418 broadway   Al-
bany NY 12270. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
GOODVETS SERVICES 
OF BROOKLYN HEIGHTS 
LLC. Articles of Organiza-
tion filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2023-03-20. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to REGISTERED AGENTS 
INC.: 418 Broadway, STE R 
Albany NY 12207. Purpose: 
Any lawful purpose

Notice of Formation of 
Bending Birches Laughing 
Skies Nurse Practitioner 
in Psychiatry, PLLC. Arti-
cles of Organization filed 
with Secretary of State of 
NY (SSNY) on 2023-05-
30. Office location: Albany 
County. SSNY designated 
as agent of Professional 
Limited Liability Company 
(PLLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Northwest Registered 
Agent LLC: 418 Broadway 
STE N Albany NY 12207. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Formation of BE-
MAG LLC. Articles of Orga-
nization filed with Secretary 
of State of NY (SSNY) on 
2022-10-07. Office loca-
tion: Albany County. SSNY 
designated as agent of 
Limited Liability Company 
(LLC) upon whom process 
against it may be served. 
SSNY should mail process 
to Northwest Registered 
Agent LLC: 418 Broadway, 
STE N Albany NY 12207. 
Purpose: Any lawful pur-
pose

Notice of Form. of MIRO-
SA DIAMONDS LLC. Arts. 
of Org. filed with SSNY on 
05/16/2023. Office loca-
tion: Albany SSNY desg. as 
agent of LLC upon whom 
process against it may be 
served. SSNY mail pro-
cess to 90 STATE STREET, 
SUITE 700 BOX 10, ALBA-
NY, NY, 12207. Any lawful 
purpose.

Notice of 
formation of C.C.S 
TRANSPORTATION, 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/20/2021. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6223777

 Notice of formation of 
ATLAS MASONRY 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
11/07/2022. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. at 
418 BROADWAY 
STE R ALBANY, NY 
12207. REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. is 
designated as agent 
for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE R 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6636771

 Notice of formation of 
GLOBAL KICKBACK 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
02/02/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. at 
418 BROADWAY 
STE R ALBANY, NY 
12207. REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. is 
designated as agent 
for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE R 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6721992

 Notice of registration 
of BREITLIGHT 
INNOVATIONS 
LLC. Certificate of 
Authority filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/03/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6758627

 Notice of formation 
of Lia Kim Design 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
03/23/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6772826

 Notice of formation 
of Acadia Collective 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
04/12/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6796902

 Notice of formation of 
TRULYUNKNOWN 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
04/19/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6801624

 Notice of formation 
of INTERNATIONAL 
COMMERCE 
ADVISORS LLC. 
Articles of Org. filed 
with the Secretary 
of State of New 
York (SSNY) on 
04/20/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6803668

 

BOGO  
40% OFF
OFFER ENDS 10/31

888-448-0421
“Selling Surplus Assets 7 Days a Week Online”

For complete information, visit 
www.HerkimerCoAuction.com
or call 800-536-1401, Ext. 111

Tax Foreclosed Real Estate Auction
Herkimer County • Online Only

Online Auction Start: Wednesday, July 19TH, 12PM
Online Auction Closing Begins: Wednesday, August 2ND, 10AM

30+ Parcels:  Lots, Acreage, Homes, Commercial Properties

To participate in this online only auction, please visit our website and complete 
the “Online Bidder Registration Packet”.

Bidder Packet Due By: Monday, July 31ST, 4PM

**Action Required**

Auctions_Intnl2x2_Herkimer_06.23.crtr - Page 1 - Composite
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Bethlehem Annex Laydown Yard

NOTICE OF MODIFICATION OF ENVIRONMENTAL MANAGEMENT AND 
CONSTRUCTION PLAN FOR CHAMPLAIN HUDSON POWER EXPRESS

Please take notice that, on or about July 5, 2023, CHPE LLC and CHPE Prop-
erties, Inc. (collectively referred to as “CHPE”) intend to request modifica-
tion of an Environmental Management & Construction Plan (“EM&CP”) for 
the Temporary Laydown Yards Segment of the proposed Champlain Hudson 
Power Express (“CHPE”) Project approved by the New York State Public Ser-
vice Commission (“PSC”) on February 16, 2023.  The proposed modification 
would add a temporary laydown yard on previously disturbed lands in the 
Town of Bethlehem (Albany County) which will be used for construction stag-
ing, marshalling, and storage during construction.  

CHPE holds a certificate of environmental compatibility and public need (Cer-
tificate), pursuant to Article VII of the Public Service Law (PSL), to construct 
and operate the CHPE Project.  The PSC approved CHPE’s Temporary Lay-
down Yards EM&CP; modifications to that approved EM&CP which impact 
areas not previously included in the EM&CP review process require addition-
al public notice and an opportunity for the community to comment.  Details 
of the planned work locations, including an overview map of the proposed 
route, are available on the Project website at: https://chpexpress.com/over-
view-of-public-documents/environmental-management-construction-plan/.  
In general, construction activities for this Segment are anticipated to com-
mence in summer 2023.  Construction of the laydown yard will generally occur 
between 7 a.m. and 7 p.m., with any high-noise construction activities occur-
ring during daylight hours as much as possible.

The approved Temporary Laydown Yards EM&CP and Bethlehem Annex Lay-
down Yard Change Notice provide detailed information regarding how the 
temporary laydown yard will be constructed.  The document describes and 
depicts the specific location of these yards including the Construction Zone 
and temporary work areas, as well as descriptions of work to be performed, 
plan and profile drawings, and protocols to be used during construction to 
protect the community and the environment, and to comply with the CHPE 
Certificate.  

The full Commission docket for the Project can be accessed via the Commis-
sion’s website at: http://documents.dps.ny.gov/public/MatterManagement/
CaseMaster.aspx?MatterCaseNo=10-T-0139 and electronic copies of EM&CP 
documents also will be available on the Project website at https://chpexpress.
com/overview-of-public-documents/environmental-management-construc-
tion-plan/.  

Comments related to the proposed Bethlehem Annex Change Notice to the 
Temporary Laydown Yard EM&CP should be submitted to the Commission 
Secretary by email at secretary@dps.ny.gov or by mail to Michelle Phillips, 
Secretary, NYS Public Service Commission, 3 Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY, 
12223. All comments should reference Case Number 10-T-0139.

CHPE has established a toll-free number for questions regarding the Project: 
1-800-991-CHPE (2473). Questions or requests for further information can 
be directed to: publicoutreach@chpexpress.com or by mail to Molly Hollister, 
WSP USA, One Pennsylvania Plaza, New York, New York 10119.

Notice of formation of 
Gotham Geothermal 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
05/05/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. at 
418 BROADWAY 
STE R ALBANY, NY 
12207. REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. is 
designated as agent 
for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE R 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6825480

 Notice of registration 
of ARDENT 
STAFFING 
SOLUTIONS, 
LLC. Certificate of 
Authority filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
05/05/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6827028

 Notice of formation 
of WBS GROOMING 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
05/17/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. at 
418 BROADWAY 
STE R ALBANY, NY 
12207. REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. is 
designated as agent 
for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE R 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6836676

 Notice of formation 
of NIMOL BEAUTY 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
05/20/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. at 
418 BROADWAY 
STE R ALBANY, NY 
12207. REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. is 
designated as agent 
for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE R 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6838884

 Notice of formation 
of Saratoga Sites, 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
05/31/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6846938

 Notice of formation 
of I Image Design 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
06/01/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. at 
418 BROADWAY 
STE R ALBANY, NY 
12207. REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. is 
designated as agent 
for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE R 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6864896

 Notice of formation 
of FIG ACADEMY 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
06/01/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. at 
418 BROADWAY 
STE R ALBANY, NY 
12207. REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. is 
designated as agent 
for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE R 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6864915

 Notice of formation 
of Laurie Chameides 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
06/05/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6867493

 

Notice of formation of 
Resilient Resource 
Groups LLC. Articles 
of Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
06/14/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6876670

 Notice of formation 
of WASHINGTON 
MARKET 
STRATEGIES LLC. 
Articles of Org. filed 
with the Secretary 
of State of New 
York (SSNY) on 
06/15/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6877871

 Notice of formation 
of Freelance Photo-
Journalist International 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
06/20/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6881142

 Notice of formation 
of MOON GRASS 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
06/22/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. at 
418 BROADWAY 
STE R ALBANY, NY 
12207. REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. is 
designated as agent 
for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE R 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6883505

 Notice of formation 
of RS MANHATTAN 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
06/26/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6885762

 Notice of registration 
of OKAM 
PROPERTIES, 
LLC. Certificate of 
Authority filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
06/27/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. at 
418 BROADWAY 
STE R ALBANY, NY 
12207. REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. is 
designated as agent 
for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE R 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6888330

 Notice of formation 
of GIANT MANLIUS 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
06/28/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. at 
418 BROADWAY 
STE R ALBANY, NY 
12207. REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. is 
designated as agent 
for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE R 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6888697

 Notice of formation 
of Field Artist 
Management LLC. 
Articles of Org. filed 
with the Secretary 
of State of New 
York (SSNY) on 
06/29/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. at 
418 BROADWAY 
STE R ALBANY, NY 
12207. REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. is 
designated as agent 
for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE R 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6889056

 

Notice of formation of 
Kingdom Kiddos Child 
Care LLC. Articles 
of Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
06/29/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for Child Care.
6889242

 Notice of formation 
of Birdies Golf Studio 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
06/29/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for Golf Services.
6889424

 Notice of formation of 
WriEd LLC. Articles 
of Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
06/29/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated 
as agent for SOP 
at 418 BROADWAY 
STE N ALBANY, NY 
12207. Company is 
organized for Writing 
and education.
6889658

 Notice of formation 
of Sapio Real Estate 
Research LLC. 
Articles of Org. filed 
with the Secretary 
of State of New 
York (SSNY) on 
06/30/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6890313

 Notice of formation of 
Be Inspired Healing 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
06/30/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for Nurse Practitioner.
6890384

 Notice of formation of 
PMM CONSULTANTS 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
06/30/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6890408

 Notice of formation of 
Gherrera enterprises 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/03/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for Management 
earnings from the 
barbering industry.
6926268

 Notice of formation 
of Golden Green 
Obsession LLC. 
Articles of Org. filed 
with the Secretary 
of State of New 
York (SSNY) on 
07/03/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6926290
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Notice of formation of 
Denise Social LLC. 
Articles of Org. filed 
with the Secretary 
of State of New 
York (SSNY) on 
07/03/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6926291

 Notice of formation 
of Echo Vertex LLC. 
Articles of Org. filed 
with the Secretary 
of State of New 
York (SSNY) on 
07/03/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6926305

 Notice of formation 
of Semper Holdings 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/03/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for Real estate holding 
company.
6926320

 Notice of formation of 
Barbagallo's Volleyball 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/03/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for Volleyball coaching 
mentoring instructing.
6926364

 Notice of formation 
of Client Convoy 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/03/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. at 
418 BROADWAY 
STE R ALBANY, NY 
12207. REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. is 
designated as agent 
for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE R 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6926925

 Notice of formation of 
Antisocial Superstars, 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/03/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for label with digital 
and physical merch.
6927029

 Notice of formation 
of My Slab Dealer 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/04/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for Retail trade.
6927155

 Notice of formation 
of ERA Dynamic 
Enterprise LLC. 
Articles of Org. filed 
with the Secretary 
of State of New 
York (SSNY) on 
07/05/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. at 
418 BROADWAY 
STE R ALBANY, NY 
12207. REGISTERED 
AGENTS INC. is 
designated as agent 
for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE R 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6927433

 

Notice of formation 
of Anneya Travel 
Group, LLC. Articles 
of Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/05/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6927444

 Notice of formation 
of Casciano Logistics 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/05/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6927445

 Notice of formation 
of DURAND G 
STYLE LLC. Articles 
of Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/05/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for Fashion.
6928082

 Notice of formation 
of Sidotsi Couture 
Cornerstone LLC. 
Articles of Org. filed 
with the Secretary 
of State of New 
York (SSNY) on 
07/05/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6928092

 Notice of formation 
of MNY Capital LLC. 
Articles of Org. filed 
with the Secretary 
of State of New 
York (SSNY) on 
07/06/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for Business Services.
6929244

 Notice of formation 
of Distribuidora MEX 
GUA LLC. Articles 
of Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/07/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for Venta y distribucion 
de productos 
Hispanos.
6929586

 Notice of formation 
of Jonny Fix It LLC. 
Articles of Org. filed 
with the Secretary 
of State of New 
York (SSNY) on 
07/07/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for Repair Services.
6929592

 Notice of formation of 
Innovate Momentum, 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/07/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for Business 
Consulting.
6929710

 

Notice of formation 
of Matthew Rigby 
Photography LLC. 
Articles of Org. filed 
with the Secretary 
of State of New 
York (SSNY) on 
07/07/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for To earn money.
6929726

 Notice of formation 
of ISG CAPITAL 
GROUP LLC. Articles 
of Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/07/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6929733

 Notice of formation of 
Parallax Leadership 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/07/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6929747

 Notice of formation of 
Timeless flor esthetic 
care LLC. Articles 
of Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/07/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6929862

 Notice of formation 
of Seitz On Sites 
LLC. Articles of 
Org. filed with the 
Secretary of State of 
New York (SSNY) on 
07/07/2023. Office 
location: ALBANY 
County, SSNY is 
designated as agent 
upon whom process 
may be served. 
SSNY shall mail 
service of process 
to NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED 
AGENT LLC at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
NORTHWEST 
REGISTERED AGENT 
LLC is designated as 
agent for SOP at 418 
BROADWAY STE N 
ALBANY, NY 12207. 
Company is organized 
for any lawful purpose.
6929955

 

THE GIRL IN THE  
RED VELVET SWING

Saturday, July 15 
7:00 PM

Tickets: $60

® NYSDED

TRAILBLAZERS
2 0 2 3
S U M M E R
F E S T I V A L

ALMA MAHLER AND 
HER CHARMED CIRCLE

Wednesday, July 19  
2:00 PM

Tickets: $60

“A TRIBUTE TO 
DAVID SMITH” -

HUB NEW MUSIC
Saturday, July 22

 7:00 PM | Tickets: $50
Presented in 
Partnership with

Visit Our Display Center at 747 Pierce Road, Clifton Park, NY, 12065
Same Day  Installation• Sales  • Rentals  • Service  • Buybacks

New and Reconditioned Lifts
Locally Owned & Operated

Regain Your Independence!
$ 200 OFF

the purchase of 

any sta
irlift

SAVE 10%

FROM OUR FAMILY TO YOURS,
LET’S MAKE YOUR KITCHEN

MAGIC

ON YOUR FULL
KITCHEN REMODEL*

NEW CABINETS | CABINET REFACING | COUNTERTOPS | BACKSPLASHES

Discount applies to purchase of new cabinets or cabinet refacing with a countertop. Does not apply to countertop only. 
May not combine with other o ers or prior purchases. Nassau: H1759490000  Su olk: 16183-H  NY/Rockland: 5642

OFFER EXPIRES 12/31/23

855.281.6439 | Free Quotes 
KITCHEN REMODELING EXPERTS

from Physicians Mutual Insurance Company

Call to get your FREE Information Kit

1-855-225-1434
Dental50Plus.com/nypress

Product not available in all states. Includes the Participating (in GA: Designated) Providers and Preventive Benefits 
Rider. Acceptance guaranteed for one insurance policy/certificate of this type. Contact us for complete details about 
this insurance solicitation. This specific offer is not available in CO, NY; call 1-800-969-4781 or respond for similar offer. 
Certificate C250A (ID: C250E; PA: C250Q); Insurance Policy P150 (GA: P150GA; NY: P150NY; OK: P150OK; TN: P150TN). Rider 
kinds: B438, B439 (GA: B439B).
6208-0721

DENTAL Insurance

“Limit your exposure to news and social media. Choose just a few 
trusted sources of news, including a local source to learn what is happening 
in your community, and turn to those media at set times — not all day. 
Use social media to connect with people you don’t get to see in person, 
but don’t spend too much time on these platforms getting news and updates 
about the disease. Otherwise, it’s easy to be consumed every moment 
of the day about the coronavirus as well as opinions and 
misinformation, all of which can be overwhelming.”

Thank you. We Agree.

NEWSPAPER POWER.
Print, Digital & Social Solutions for our advertisers.

Design by Metro Creative Graphics, Inc.

Be Well:
READ A LOCAL
NEWSPAPER

Source: The Pancreatic Cancer Action Network

The Pancreatic Cancer Action Network issued a list of “Tips and Practices for Self Care” 
to help “your physical, emotional, mental ad spiritual health” during the long-running 
pandemic. Among the actions listed under “Take a Break” was this practical advice:
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ADVERTISE HERE & ONLINE @ THEUPSTATER.COM

ATTORNEY
D I V O R C E 

$389 - Uncontest-
ed divorce papers 
prepared. Only one 
signature required. 
Poor person Appli-
cation included if 
applicable. Sepa-
ration agreements. 
Custody and sup-
port petitions. 518-
274-0380

AUTO 
DONATIONS

Drive Out 
Breast Cancer: 
Donate a car to-
day!  The benefits 
of donating your 
car or boat:  Fast 
Free Pickup - 24hr 

Response   Tax 
Deduction - Easy 
To Do!  Call 24/7:  
855-905-4755

EDUCATION 
/ CAREER 
TRAINING
COMPUTER 

& IT TRAINING 
PROGRAM! Train 
ONLINE to get the 
skills to become a 
Computer & Help 
Desk Profession-
al now! Grants 
and Scholarships 
available for cer-
tain programs for 
qualified appli-
cants. Call CTI for 
details! 844-947-
0192 (M-F 8am-
6pm ET). Comput-
er with internet is 
required.

TRAIN ON-
LINE TO DO 
MEDICAL BILL-
ING! Become a 
Medical Office 
Professional on-
line at CTI! Get 
Trained, Certified 
& ready to work in 
months! Call 855-
543-6440. (M-F 
8am-6pm ET). 
Computer with in-
ternet is required.

FINANCE
ARE YOU BE-

HIND $10k OR 
MORE ON YOUR 
TAXES? Stop 
wage & bank lev-
ies, liens & audits, 
unfiled tax returns, 
payroll issues, & 

resolve tax debt 
FAST. Call 888-
869-5361 (Hours:  
Mon-Fri 7am-5pm 
PST)

HEALTH
VIAGRA and 

CIALIS USERS! 
50 Pills SPECIAL 
$99.00 FREE 
Shipping! 100% 
guaranteed. CALL 
NOW! 855-413-
9574

HOME 
IMPROVE-

MENT
Do you need 

a Roof or Ener-
gy Efficient Win-
dows & Help pay-
ing for it? YOU 
MAY QUALIFY 
THROUGH NEW 

RELIEF PRO-
GRAMS (800) 
944-9393 or visit 
NYProgramFund-
ing.org to qualify. 
Approved applica-
tions will have the 
work completed by 
a repair crew pro-
vided by: HOME-
OWNER FUND-
ING. Not affiliated 
with State or Gov 
Programs.

BATH & 
SHOWER UP-
DATES in as lit-
tle as ONE DAY! 
Affordable pric-
es - No payments 
for 18 months! 
Lifetime warran-
ty & professional 
installs. Senior & 
Military Discounts 

available. Call: 
866-393-3636

MISC
BEST SATEL-

LITE TV with 2 
Year Price Guar-
antee! $59.99/mo 
with 190 channels 
and 3 months free 
premium mov-
ie channels! Free 
next day instal-
lation! Call 888-
508-5313

Use ItchNo-
More® shampoo 
on dogs & cats to 
relieve secondary 
dermatits, treat 
yeast infections, 
& eliminate dog-
gy odor. At Tractor 
Supply® (www.
h a p p y j a c k i n c .

com)

TV 
INTERNET 

PHONE
DISH TV 

$64.99 For 190 
Channels + $14.95 
High Speed Inter-
net.  Free Instal-
lation, Smart HD 
DVR Included, 
Free Voice Re-
mote. Some re-
strictions apply.  
Promo Expires 
1/31/24. 1-866-
595-6967

D I R E C T V . 
New 2-Year Price 
Guarantee. The 
most live MLB 
games this season, 
200+ channels 
and over 45,000 

on-demand titles. 
$84.99/mo for 
24 months with 
CHOICE Pack-
age. Some restric-
tions apply. Call 
DIRECTV 1-888-
534-6918

LINE ADS

LEGALS
Section of Law - 206
 
 
Goodwoodfloor  LLC.
Filed  1/18/23.  Office:
Greene Co. SSNY desig.
as agent  for process &
shall  mail  to:  126  Tool
House  Rd,  Catskill,  NY
12414.  Registered
Agent:  United  States
Corporation  Agents,
Inc., 7014 13th Ave , Ste
202,  Bklyn,  NY  11228.
Purpose: General.

Join host Katherine Haine, President & CEO of City Media Inc.,
as she walks you though how to engage with your customers
online, why it is more important than ever & tips for how you
can connect with your audience in an easy & engaging way. 
 

In this webinar, learn how your Digital Footprint can help you
reach more customers online. How do your customers find
you? How do you rank against your competitors? We will
provide practical tips & tricks to use reviews, social media &
digital advertising to create meaningful engagement with your
customers & community. We begin with the end in mind. Think
about what action do you want your clients to take? Buy
more? Call you? Learn how to help them do that.

How to be found on Google 
How to create a great social media strategy
How to create engaging content 
How to increase engagement online, including 

Why you need to reply to all reviews, and how to 

How to use your Google Business Page to get the 

SPECIFICALLY WHAT YOU WILL LEARN:

       resources 

       handle negative ones

       most reach and rise above competitors in your field 

Wed. July 19, 2023 • 12pm - 1pm EST
Bethlehem Public Library,
451 Delaware Avenue, Bethlehem NY
& Via Zoom

To register, visit: NYVTMedia.com/Digital-Webinar-July2023

Proudly Presented By:
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98 MAIN ST, RAVENA, NY • LONGENERGY.COM

FUEL DELIVERY 24 / 7 / 365

518-756-2555
Family-Owned Since 1945

Did you know 
that Long Energy is actively seeking approval from 

the Coeymans Planning Board for propane storage on Route 9W? This 
project has garnered significant attention, with multiple articles in the Times Union 
covering the latest developments. However, our progress has hit a roadblock. On 
April 26, 2023, the project approval vote resulted in a deadlock (3-3).

 We want to emphasize that we have meticulously adhered to all legal 
requirements and have gone above and beyond to anticipate and accommodate the 
wishes of your community. As one Board member astutely stated during the April 
26th meeting, “When I fall back to the code, the site plan section and the special-
use section, if I went through that, they are in compliance with everything.”

 We deeply value the support of our customers, and we remain committed 
to offering more competitively priced fuel and service. By granting approval for 
this propane storage, we can enhance our ability to meet the energy needs of the 
community efficiently and effectively.

 We appreciate your continued support and kindly encourage you to voice your 
opinions and help us tell the Town Planning Board to

“FOLLOW THE CODE. APPROVE THE PLAN!” 
 Together, we can ensure a reliable and affordable energy future for everyone in 
our community.

HVAC
Plumbing
Generac Generators

Propane
Fuel Oil
Diesel

Offering Propane and Heating Oil Energy Savings Contract at No Charge
 (Value at over $200) Terms and Conditions Apply

COEYMANS RESIDENTS
ATTENTION

ADVERTORIAL


